Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2017 No. 225

The Energy Performance of Buildings
(Scotland) Amendment Regulations 2017

Citation, commencement and interpretation
1.—(1) These Regulations may be cited as the Energy Performance of Buildings (Scotland)
Amendment Regulations 2017 and come into force on 1st October 2017.

(2) In these Regulations “the 2008 Regulations” means the Energy Performance of Buildings
(Scotland) Regulations 2008(1).

Amendment of the Energy Performance of Buildings (Scotland) Regulations 2008
2.—(1) Subject to regulation 3, the 2008 Regulations are amended in accordance with
paragraph (2).
(2) Inregulation 10A (fees for entering data onto register)—
(a) in paragraph (a) for “£1.15” substitute “£2.60”’; and
(b) in paragraph (b) for “£5.36” substitute “£12.10”.

Savings

3. Notwithstanding the amendment of the 2008 Regulations by regulation 2, the 2008 Regulations
continue to apply as they did immediately before 1st October 2017 in respect of the entering of data
on a register maintained in accordance with regulation 10 of the 2008 Regulations where that data
was sent to the register before that date.

St Andrew’s House,
Edinburgh KEVIN STEWART
27th June 2017 Authorised to sign by the Scottish Ministers

(1) S.S.I.2008/309 as relevantly amended by S.S.1. 2012/208.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2008/309
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2012/208

