Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2013 No. 123

The Action Programme for Nitrate Vulnerable
Zones (Scotland) Amendment Regulations 2013

Amendment of Schedule 3

11.—(1) In Schedule 3 (calculation of maximum nitrogen application to crops), Table 5
(percentage nitrogen content taken up by a crop per given quantity of livestock manure) is amended
as follows.

(2) In Column 3, in the line regarding cattle slurry, for “35%” substitute “40%”.
(3) In Column 3, in the line regarding pig slurry, for “45%” substitute “50%"".



