
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2012 No. 109

The Community Care (Personal Care and Nursing
Care) (Scotland) Amendment Regulations 2012

Citation and commencement

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Community Care (Personal Care and Nursing Care)
(Scotland) Amendment Regulations 2012 and come into force on 1st April 2012.

Amendment of the Community Care (Personal Care and Nursing Care) (Scotland)
Regulations 2002

2.—(1)  The Community Care (Personal Care and Nursing Care) (Scotland) Regulations 2002(1)
are amended as follows.

(2)  In regulation 2 (accommodation provided under the Social Work (Scotland) Act 1968 or
section 25 of the Mental Health (Care and Treatment) (Scotland) Act 2003)—

(a) in paragraph (a), for “£159” substitute “£163”; and
(b) in paragraph (b), for “£72” substitute “£74”.

Revocations

3. The following Regulations are revoked—
(a) the Community Care (Personal Care and Nursing Care) (Scotland) Amendment

Regulations 2008(2);
(b) the Community Care (Personal Care and Nursing Care) (Scotland) Amendment

Regulations 2009(3);
(c) the Community Care (Personal Care and Nursing Care) (Scotland) Amendment

Regulations 2010(4); and
(d) the Community Care (Personal Care and Nursing Care) (Scotland) Amendment

Regulations 2011(5).

St Andrew’s House,
Edinburgh
28th March 2012

NICOLA STURGEON
A member of the Scottish Executive

(1) S.S.I. 2002/303 as amended by S.S.I. 2005/445, 2008/78, 2009/138, 2010/117 and 2011/230.
(2) S.S.I. 2008/78.
(3) S.S.I. 2009/138.
(4) S.S.I. 2010/117.
(5) S.S.I. 2011/230.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2002/303
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2005/445
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2008/78
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2009/138
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2010/117
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2011/230
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2008/78
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2009/138
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2010/117
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2011/230

