Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2011 No. 148

The Police Grant (Carry-forward
Percentages) (Scotland) Order 2011

Amendment of the Police (Scotland) Act 1967
2.—(1) The Police (Scotland) Act 1967 is amended in accordance with paragraphs (2) and (3).

(2) In section 19 (schemes for amalgamation of police forces)—
(a) in subsection (3A)(a) for “three per cent.” substitute “four per cent.”; and
(b) in subsection (3C) for “five per cent.” substitute “eight per cent.”.

(3) In section 32 (police grant)—
(a) in subsection (10B) for “three per cent.” substitute “four per cent.”; and

(b) in subsection (10F)(a) and (b) for “five per cent.” substitute “eight per cent.”.



