Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2009 No. 64

The Registration Services (Fees, etc.)
(Scotland) Amendment Regulations 2009

Citation and commencement

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Registration Services (Fees, etc.) (Scotland)
Amendment Regulations 2009 and come into force on 1st April 2009.

Amendments to the Registration Services (Fees, etc.) (Scotland) Regulations 2006

2.—(1) The Registration Services (Fees, etc.) (Scotland) Regulations 2006(1) are amended in
accordance with paragraphs (2) to (4).

(2) In Part II of Schedule 2 (fees payable to district registrars for issue of extracts of entries
in statutory registers and parochial registers) in column 3 of entries 1 and 2, for “£8.50” substitute
“£9.00”.

(3) In Part I of Schedule 3 (fees payable under the Marriage (Scotland) Act 1977)—
(a) in column 3-
(1) for “£26.00” substitute “£28.00”; and
(i1) for “£46.50” substitute “£50.00”; and
(b) omit column 4.
(4) In Part II of Schedule 3 (fees payable under the Civil Partnership Act 2004 — registration)—
(a) in column 3—
(1) for “£26.00” substitute “£28.00”; and
(i1) for “£46.50” substitute “£50.00”; and

(b) omit column 4.

New Register House,
Edinburgh PAUL M PARR
19th February 2009 Deputy Registrar General for Scotland

(1) S.S.I.2006/575, as amended by S.S.I. 2007/531.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2006/575
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2007/531

Document Generated: 2024-06-06
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

Approved by the Scottish Ministers

St Andrew’s House,
Edinburgh JIM MATHER
23rd February 2009 Authorised to sign by the Scottish Ministers



