
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2009 No. 151

The Public Service Vehicles (Registration of Local
Services) (Scotland) Amendment Regulations 2009

Amendment of the Public Service Vehicles (Registration of Local Services) (Scotland)
Regulations 2001

2.—(1)  The Public Service Vehicles (Registration of Local Services) (Scotland) Regulations
2001(1) are amended in accordance with this regulation.

(2)  In regulation 13(1)(a) and (2)(a) for “£12” substitute “£13”.
(3)  In regulation 13(1)(b) and (2)(b) for “£57” substitute “£60”.

(1) S.S.I. 2001/219; amended by S.S.I. 2001/251, 2002/548, 2004/415, 2005/346, 2007/79 and 2008/253.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2001/219
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2001/251
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2002/548
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2004/415
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2005/346
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2007/79
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2008/253

