Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2007 No. 551

The Budget (Scotland) Act 2007 Amendment Order 2007

Amendment of section 3 of the 2007 Act

2. In section 3 of the 2007 Act (overall cash authorisations)—
(a) in paragraph (a), for “£26,145,154,000” substitute “£26,639,917,000”;
(b) in paragraph (b), for “£66,349,000” substitute “£77,649,000’; and
(c) in paragraph (e), for “£6,585,000” substitute “£9,032,000”.



