
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2007 No. 14

The Civil Legal Aid (Scotland)
(Fees) Amendment Regulations 2007

Amendment of the Civil Legal Aid (Scotland) (Fees) Regulations 1989

5. In the Table of Fees in Chapter III of Schedule 2–
(a) in Part I–

(i) in paragraph 1, for “£44.20” substitute “£53.50”;
(ii) in paragraph 2, for “£5.05” and “£14.20” substitute “£6.10” and “£17.20”

respectively; and
(iii) in paragraph 3, for “£14.20” substitute “£17.20”; and

(b) in Part II–
(i) in paragraph 1, for “£60.70” substitute “£73.45”;

(ii) in paragraph 2, for “£5.05”, “£10.80”, “£5.05” and “£15.80” substitute “£6.10”,
“£13.05”, “£6.10” and “£19.10” respectively;

(iii) in paragraph 3, for “£15.80” substitute “£19.10”;
(iv) in paragraph 4, for “£54.80” substitute “£66.30”;
(v) in paragraph 5, for “£27.40” substitute “£33.15”;

(vi) in paragraph 6, for “£23.40” and “£10.80” substitute “£28.30” and “£13.05”
respectively;

(vii) in paragraph 7, for “£23.40” and “£10.80” substitute “£28.30” and “£13.05”
respectively;

(viii) in paragraph 8, for “£33.30” and “£20.00” substitute “£40.30” and “£24.20”
respectively;

(ix) in paragraph 9, for “£27.40” and “£15.80” substitute “£33.15” and “£19.10”
respectively;

(x) in paragraph 10, for “£15.80” and “£8.40” substitute “£19.10” and “£10.15”
respectively;

(xi) in paragraph 11, for “£33.30”, “£23.40”, “£23.40” and “£54.80” substitute “£40.30”,
“£28.30”, “£28.30” and “£66.30” respectively;

(xii) in paragraph 12, for “£27.40”, “£25.00”, “£15.80” and “£10.80” substitute “£33.15”,
“£30.25”, “£19.10” and “£13.05” respectively;

(xiii) in paragraph 13, for “£33.30”, “£20.00”, “£27.40”, “£15.80”, “£15.80”, “£10.80”,
“£15.00” and “£10.00” substitute “£40.30”, “£24.20”, “£33.15”, “£19.10”,
“£19.10”, “£13.05”, “£18.15” and “£12.10” respectively;

(xiv) in paragraph 14, for “£10.80” substitute “£13.05”;
(xv) in paragraph 15, for “£74.90” and “£15.80” substitute “£90.65” and “£19.10”

respectively; and



Document Generated: 2023-07-28
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(xvi) in paragraph 16, for “£33.30”, “£33.30” and “£15.80” substitute “£40.30”, “£40.30”
and “£19.10” respectively.

2


