Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2006 No. 515

The Criminal Legal Aid (Scotland)
(Fees) Amendment Regulations 2006

Amendment of the Criminal Legal Aid (Scotland) (Fees) Regulations 1989
6. Schedule 1(1) is amended as follows—

(a)
(b)
()
(d)
(e)
®
(8)
(h)

at paragraph 1(a), for “£31.50” substitute “£34.02”;

at paragraph 1(b), for “£15.75” substitute “£17.01”;

at paragraph 2, for “£11.05” substitute “£12.38”;

at paragraph 3(a), for “£10.55”, where it second occurs, substitute “£11.82”;
at paragraph 3(b), for “£5.25”, where it second occurs, substitute “£5.88”;
at paragraph 4, for “£6.00”, where it second occurs, substitute “£6.72”;

at paragraph 5, for “£2.40”, where it second occurs, substitute “£2.69”’; and
at paragraph 6, for “£0.08”, where it second occurs, substitute “£0.09”.

(1) Schedule 1 was substituted by S.S.I. 2004/264 and amended by S.S.I. 2005/656.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2004/264
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2005/656

