Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2006 No. 207
SHERIFF COURT

Act of Sederunt (Ordinary Cause Rules) Amendment
(Family Law (Scotland) Act 2006 etc.) 2006

Made - - - - 12th April 2006
Coming into force - - 4th May 2006

The Lords of Council and Session, under and by virtue of the powers conferred by section 32 of
the Sheriff Courts (Scotland) Act 1971(1) and of all other powers enabling them in that behalf,
having approved draft rules submitted to them by the Sheriff Court Rules Council in accordance
with section 34 of the said Act of 1971, do hereby enact and declare:

Citation and commencement

1.—(1) This Act of Sederunt may be cited as the Act of Sederunt (Ordinary Cause Rules)
Amendment (Family Law (Scotland) Act 2006 etc.) 2006 and shall come into force on 4th May 2006.

(2) This Act of Sederunt shall be inserted in the Books of Sederunt.

Amendment of the Ordinary Cause Rules

2.—(1) The Ordinary Cause Rules in Schedule 1 to the Sheriff Courts (Scotland) Act 1907(2)
shall be amended in accordance with the following sub-paragraphs.

(2) In rule 3.3(1) (warrants of citation) after sub-paragraph (d) there shall be inserted the
following:—

“(e) a civil partnership action within the meaning of rule 33A.1(1)(3).”.

(3) Inrule 5.1(2) (signature of warrants)—
(a) in sub-paragraph (c), for “improper” there shall be substituted “alleged”; and
(b) after sub-paragraph (c) there shall be inserted the following:—

(1) 1971 c. 58. Section 32 was amended by the Law Reform (Miscellaneous Provisions) (Scotland) Act 1985 (c. 73), Schedule 2,
paragraph 12, the Civil Evidence (Scotland) Act 1988 (c. 32), section 2(4), the Children (Scotland) Act 1995 (c. 36),
Schedule 4, paragraph 18(2), the Adults with Incapacity (Scotland) Act 2000 (asp4), schedule 5, paragraph 13 and the Debt
Arrangement and Attachment (Scotland) Act 2002 (asp17), section 43 and was extended by the Child Support Act 1991
(c. 48), sections 39(2) and 49 and the Vulnerable Witnesses (Scotland) Act 2004 (asp3), section 14(2).

(2) 1907 c. 51. Schedule 1 was substituted by S.I. 1993/1956 and amended by S.I. 1996/2167 and 2445, S.S.1. 2000/239 and 408,
2001/8 and 144, 2002/7, 128 and 566, 2003/25 and 26, 2004/197 and 350 and 2005/20, 189, 638 and 648.

(3) Rule 33A.1 was inserted by S.S.I. 2005/638.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1971/58
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1985/73
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1988/32
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1995/36
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/asp/2000/4
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/asp/2002/17
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/asp/2002/17
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1991/48
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1991/48
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/asp/2004/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1907/51
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1993/1956
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1996/2167
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1996/2445
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2000/239
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2000/408
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2001/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2001/144
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2002/7
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2002/128
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2002/566
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2003/25
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2003/26
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2004/197
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2004/350
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2005/20
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2005/189
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2005/638
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2005/648
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2005/638

Document Generated: 2023-05-25
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

“(d) a warrant for intimation ordered under rule 33A.8 (intimation where alleged
association).”.

(4) After rule 5.2(1)(a) (form of citation and certificate) there shall be inserted the following:—
“(aa) a civil partnership action within the meaning of rule 33A.1(1);”.

(5) Inrule 8.1(1) (reponing)—
(a) in sub-paragraph (a), after “(h)” there shall be inserted “(n) or (0)”; and
(b) after sub-paragraph (a) there shall be inserted the following:—

“(aa) a cause mentioned in rule 33A.1(a), (b) or (f) (certain civil partnership
actions);”.

(6) In rule 9.1(1) (notice of intention to defend)(4), after “action)” there shall be inserted “,
33A.34 (notice of intention to defend and defences in civil partnership action)(5)”.

(7) Inrule 9.2 (fixing date for options hearing)—

(a) in paragraph (1A)(6), after “action” there shall be inserted “or a civil partnership action”;
and

(b) for paragraph (1B)(7) there shall be substituted the following:—
“(1B) In paragraph (1A) above—
(a) “family action” has the meaning given in rule 33.1(1); and
(b) “civil partnership action” has the meaning given in rule 33A.1(1).”.

(8) Inrule 9.6(3) (defences)(8), after “rule 33.1(1))” there shall be inserted “or a civil partnership
action (within the meaning of rule 33A.1(1))”.

(9) In rule 9.12(7) (options hearing), for “and 33.37 (decree by default in family action)” there
shall be substituted ““, 33.37 (decree by default in family action) and 33A.37 (decree by default in
civil partnership action)(9)”.

(10) Inrule 12.2(3) (further provisions in relation to interlocutors)(10), after “rule 33.1(1)” there
shall be inserted “or a civil partnership action within the meaning of rule 33A.1(1)”.

(11) In rule 16.1 (application of Chapter 16: decrees by default), after paragraph (a) there shall
be inserted the following:—

“(aa) an action to which rule 33A.37 (decree by default in a civil partnership action)
applies;”

(12) Inrule 17.1 (application of Chapter 17), after paragraph (a) there shall be inserted—
“(aa) a civil partnership action within the meaning of rule 33A.1(1);”.

(13) In rule 19.1(1) (counterclaims), after “rule 33.1(1)” there shall be inserted, “, a civil
partnership action within the meaning of rule 33A.1(1)”.

(14) In rule 33.1(interpretation of Chapter 33: family actions)—
(a) in paragraph (1), after sub-paragraph (m) there shall be inserted—
“(n) an action of declarator of marriage;

(o) an action of declarator of nullity of marriage.”; and

(4) Rule 9.1(1) was amended by S.I. 1996/2167.
(5) Rule 33A.34 was inserted by S.S.1. 2005/638.
(6) Rule 9.2(1A) was inserted by S.S.I. 2000/239.
(7) Rule 9.2(1B) was inserted by S.S.1. 2000/239.
(8) Rule 9.6(3) was inserted by S.I. 1996/2167.

(9) Rule 33A.37 was inserted by S.S.I. 2005/638.
(10) Rule 12.2(3) was substituted by S.I. 1996/2445.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1996/2167
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2005/638
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2000/239
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2000/239
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1996/2167
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2005/638
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1996/2445

Document Generated: 2023-05-25
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(b) in paragraph (2), for the definition of “mental disorder” there shall be substituted—

13133

mental disorder” has the meaning assigned in section 328 of the Mental Health
(Care and Treatment) (Scotland) Act 2003(11)

(15) Inrule 33.2 (averments in actions of divorce or separation about other proceedings)—

(i) for the heading there shall be substituted, “Averments in certain family actions about other
proceedings”;

(i1) in paragraph (1), for “or separation” there shall be substituted “, separation, declarator of
marriage or declarator of nullity of marriage”; and

(iii) in paragraph (2)(b)(v)(12), for the words from “or Council Regulation” to “spouses” there
shall be substituted “or Council Regulation (E.C.) No. 2201/2003 of 27th November 2003
concerning jurisdiction and the recognition and enforcement of judgments in matrimonial
matters and matters of parental responsibility(13).”

(16) Inrule 33.3(1)(a) (averments where section 11 order sought), for “or separation” there shall
be substituted “, separation or declarator of nullity of marriage”.

(17) Inrule 33.7 (warrants and forms for intimation)—
(a) in paragraph (1)(c)(i) “and” shall be omitted;
(b) after paragraph (1)(c)(ii) there shall be inserted the following:—

“(ii1) any person holding the office of guardian or continuing or welfare attorney to
the defender under or by virtue of the Adults with Incapacity (Scotland) Act
2000(14),”

(c) inparagraph (1)(e), for “or separation” there shall be substituted **, separation or declarator
of nullity of marriage”; and

(d) in paragraph (5), for “or (1)’ there shall be substituted *, (1) or (m)”.
(18) In rule 33.8 (intimation where improper association)—
(a) in the heading for “improper” there shall be substituted “alleged”;
(b) inparagraph (1), for “alleges an improper” there shall be substituted “founds upon an”; and
(¢) in paragraph (4) “improper” shall be omitted.

(19) In rule 33.9(a) (productions in action of divorce or where section 11 order may be made),
after “divorce” there shall be inserted “or declarator of nullity of marriage”.

(20) Inrule 33.12(2)(b) (execution of service on, or intimation to, local authority), for “motion”
there shall be substituted “crave”.

(21) Inrule 33.14(1) (notices in certain actions of divorce or separation)—
(a) in sub-paragraph (a), for “two years” there shall be substituted “one year”;
(b) in sub-paragraph (b), for “five” there shall be substituted “two’’; and
(c) after sub-paragraph (b), there shall be inserted the following:—

“(c) in an action relying on section 1(1)(b) of the Act of 1976 (grounds for divorce:
interim gender recognition certificate), a notice in Form F24A”.

(22) Inrule 33.16 (appointment of curators ad litem to defenders)—

(a) in paragraph (1), for “or separation” there shall be substituted “, separation or declarator
of nullity of marriage”; and

(11) 2003 asp13.
(12) Rule 33.2(2) was amended by S.S.1. 2001/144.
(13) O.J. No. L 38, 23.12.2003, p.1.

(14) 2000 aspd.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/asp/2003/13
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2001/144
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/asp/2000/4

Document Generated: 2023-05-25
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(b) in paragraph (2)(b), for “two years” there shall be substituted “one year”.

(23) In rule 33.18(1) (notices of consent to divorce or separation), for “two years” there shall
be substituted “one year”;

(24) Inrule 33.25(c)(ii) (intimation to local authority before supervised contact order), “to”” where
it second occurs shall be omitted.

(25) For rule 33.27A(15) there shall be substituted—

“Applications for postponement of decree under section 3A of the Act of 1976

33.27A. An application under section 3A(1)(16) (application for postponement of decree
where religious impediment to marry exists) or section 3A(4) (application for recall of
postponement) of the Act of 1976 shall be made by minute in the process of the action to which
the application relates.”;

(26) In rule 33.30 (extracts of undefended decree), for “pursuers” there shall be substituted
“pursuer”.

(27) Inrule 33.37(2), after “(h)” there shall be inserted “, (n) or (0)”.

(28) In rule 33.38 (application and interpretation of Part IV of Chapter 33: applications and
orders relating to children in certain family actions), for “or separation” there shall be substituted ©,
separation or declarator of nullity of marriage”.

(29) Inrule 33.59(1) (applications relating to agreement on aliment), after “paragraph (2)” there
shall be inserted “and rule 33A.53”.

(30) In rule 33.60 (application of Part IX of Chapter 33: applications for orders under section 11
of the Children (Scotland) Act 1995), for “or separation” there shall be substituted *, separation or
declarator of nullity of marriage”.

(31) Inrule 33.63 (applications relating to interim orders in depending family actions), “an order
for” shall be omitted.
(32) Inrule 33.68 (defenders)—
(a) in paragraph (b) “and” shall be omitted; and
(b) after paragraph (c) there shall be inserted—

;and

(d) where the application is made under section 18A of the Act of 1981(17)
(application for domestic interdict), the other partner.”.

(33) Inrule 33.69(1) (applications by motion), sub-paragraph (d) shall be omitted.
(34) Inrule 33.70(1) (applications by minute), sub-paragraph (b) shall be omitted.
(35) Rule 33.72 (certificates of delivery of documents to chief constable)(18) shall be omitted.
(36) Inrule 33.73(1) (application and interpretation of Part XI: simplified divorce applications)—
(a) in sub-paragraph (a)—
(1) for “two years” there shall be substituted “one year”;
(i1) for “five” there shall be substituted “two”’; and

(iii) after “years)” there shall be inserted “or section 1(1)(b) (issue of interim gender
recognition certificate)(19)”.

(15) Rule 33.27A was inserted by S.S.I. 2001/144 and was amended by S.S.1. 2005/6438.

(16) Section 3A was inserted by section 15 of the Family Law (Scotland) Act 2006 (asp2).

(17) Section 18A was inserted by section 31 of the Family Law (Scotland) Act 2006 (asp2).

(18) Rule 33.72 was amended by S.I. 1996/2445.

(19) Section 1(1)(b) was inserted by paragraph 6 of Schedule 2 to the Gender Recognition Act 2004 (c. 7).
4


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2001/144
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2005/648
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/asp/2006/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/asp/2006/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1996/2445
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2004/7

Document Generated: 2023-05-25
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(b) in sub-paragraph (e) “and” shall be omitted; and
(c) after sub-paragraph (f) there shall be inserted the following:—
“;and
(g) there is no religious impediment to the remarriage of either party”.

(37) Inrule 33.74 (form of simplified divorce applications)—

(a) in paragraph (1), for “two years” there shall be substituted “one year”;

(b) in paragraph (2), for “five” there shall be substituted “two”; and

(c) after paragraph (2) there shall be inserted—

“(3) A simplified divorce application in which the facts set out in section 1(1)(b) of
the Act of 1976 (grounds of divorce: interim gender recognition certificate) are relied on
shall be made in Form F33A and shall only be of effect if signed by the applicant.”.

(38) Inrule 33.75 (lodging of applications)—
(a) in paragraph (a) “and” shall be omitted; and
(b) after paragraph (b) there shall be inserted the following:—
“;and

(c) in an application under section 1(1)(b) of the Act of 1976 (grounds of divorce:
interim gender recognition certificate), the interim gender recognition certificate
or a certified copy within the meaning of rule 33.9A(3)(20).”.

(39) Inrule 33.76(3) (citation and intimation)—
(a) in sub-paragraph (a) “and” shall be omitted; and
(b) after paragraph (b) there shall be inserted the following:—

“(c) in an application relying on the facts in section 1(1)(b) of the Act of 1976
shall be in Form F35A.”.

(40) Inrule 33.77(1) (citation where address not known)—
(a) for “five” there shall be substituted “two”’; and

(b) after “years)” there shall be inserted “or section 1(1)(b) of the Act of 1976 (grounds of
divorce: issue of interim gender recognition certificate)”.

(41) In rule 33A.1(1) (interpretation of Chapter 33A: civil partnership actions)(21), after sub-
paragraph (e), there shall be inserted the following:—

“f) an action for declarator of nullity of civil partnership.”.

(42) Inrule 33A.2 (averments in actions of dissolution of civil partnership or separation of civil
partners)—

(a) for the heading there shall be substituted, “Averments in certain civil partnership actions
about other proceedings”; and

(b) in paragraph (1), after “dissolution” there shall be inserted “or declarator of nullity”.

(43) In rule 33A.3(1)(a) (averments where section 11 order sought), after “dissolution” there
shall be inserted “or declarator of nullity”.

(44) In rule 33A.7(1)(c) (warrants and forms for intimation), after “dissolution” there shall be
inserted “or declarator of nullity”.

(45) Inrule 33A.9(2) (productions in action of dissolution of civil partnership or where section 11
order may be made), after “dissolution” there shall be inserted “or declarator of nullity”.

(20) Rule 33.9A was inserted by S.S.1. 2005/189.
(21) Chapter 33A was inserted by S.S.1. 2005/638.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2005/189
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2005/638

Document Generated: 2023-05-25
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(46) Inrule 33A.14(1) (notices in certain actions of dissolution of civil partnership or separation
of civil partners)—

(a) in sub-paragraph (a), for “two years” there shall be substituted “one year”;
(b) in sub-paragraph (b), for “five” there shall be substituted “two”’; and
(c) after sub-paragraph (b), there shall be inserted the following:—

“(¢) in an action relying on section 117(2)(b) of the Act of 2004 (grounds of
dissolution: interim gender recognition certificate), a notice in Form CP25A.”.

(47) Inrule 33A.16 (appointment of curators ad litem to defenders)—
(a) in paragraph (1), after “dissolution” there shall be inserted “or declarator of nullity”; and
(b) in paragraph (2)(b), for “two years” there shall be substituted “one year”.

(48) Inrule 33A.18(1) (notices of consent to dissolution of civil partnership or separation of civil
partners), for “two years” there shall be substituted “one year”.

(49) Inrule 33A.37(2)(a) (decree by default), for “or (b)” there shall be substituted “(b) or (f)”.

(50) In rule 33A.38 (application and interpretation of Part IV of Chapter 33A: applications and
orders relating to children in civil partnership actions), after “dissolution” there shall be inserted “or
declarator of nullity”.

(51) Inrule 33A.44(1) (application and interpretation of Part V of Chapter 33A: orders relating
to financial provision in civil partnership actions), after “dissolution” there shall be inserted “or
declarator of nullity”.

(52) In rule 33A.54 (application of Part IX of Chapter 33A: applications for orders under
section 11 of the Children (Scotland) Act 1995 in civil partnership actions), after “dissolution” there
shall be inserted “or declarator of nullity”.

(53) Inrule 33A.62(1) (applications by motion), sub-paragraph (d) shall be omitted.
(54) Rule 33A.65 (certificates of delivery of documents to chief constable) shall be omitted.

(55) Inrule 33A.66(1)(a) (application and interpretation of Part XI of Chapter 33A: simplified
dissolution of civil partnership applications)—

(a) for “two years” there shall be substituted “one year”; and
(b) for “five” there shall be substituted “two”.
(56) Inrule 33A.67 (form of applications) the following:—
(a) in paragraph (1), for “two years” there shall be substituted “one year”; and
(b) in paragraph (2), for “five” there shall be substituted “two”.
(57) Inrule 33A.70(1) (citation where address not known), for “five” there shall be substituted

99

“two”.
(58) After Chapter 33A (civil partnership actions) there shall be inserted—

“CHAPTER 33B
FINANCIAL PROVISION FOR FORMER COHABITANTS

Interpretation of this Chapter
33B. In this Chapter—



Document Generated: 2023-05-25
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

“the Act” means the Family Law (Scotland) Act 2006(22);

“cohabitant” has the meaning given in section 25 of the Act;

“the deceased” means the cohabitant referred to in section 29(1)(a) of the Act;
“net intestate estate” has the meaning given in section 29(10) of the Act;

“the survivor” means the cohabitant referred to in section 29(1)(b) of the Act.

33B.—(1) An application under—

(a) section 28(2) of the Act for an order for financial provision where cohabitation ends
otherwise than by death; or

(b) section 29(2) of the Act for an order for financial provision by the survivor on
intestacy,

shall be made by initial writ.
(2) In an initial writ under paragraph (1)(b) the pursuer shall—
(a) name the deceased’s executor as the defender; and

(b) include a crave for a warrant for intimation to any person having an interest in the
deceased’s net intestate estate, and a notice of intimation in Form COI1 shall be
attached to the initial writ intimated to any such person.

(3) Where the identity or address of any person referred to in paragraph (2)(b) is not known
and cannot be ascertained, the pursuer shall include in his pleadings an averment of that fact
and averments setting out what steps have been taken to identify the identity or address, as the
case may be, of that person.

(4) An application under section 29(9) of the Act for variation of the date or method of
payment of a capital sum shall be made by minute in the process of the action to which the
application relates.”.

(59) Inrule 41.2 (attachment of power of arrest to interdict)(23), after “section 1(2)” there shall
be inserted “or (1A)(24)”.

(60) Appendix 1 shall be amended as follows:—
(a) in paragraph 1(a) of Form F19, for “two years” there shall be substituted “one year”;
(b) in paragraph 1(a) of Form F21, for “two years” there shall be substituted “one year”;
(c) in Form F23—
(i) in the heading, for “five” there shall be substituted “two”;
(i1) in paragraph 1—
(aa) for “five” there shall be substituted “two”’; and
(bb) the words from “unless” to the end of that paragraph shall be omitted; and
(ii1) in paragraph 3, for “five” there shall be substituted “two”;
(d) in Form F24—
(i) in the heading, for “five” there shall be substituted “two;
(i1) in paragraph 1—
(aa) for “five” there shall be substituted “two”’; and

(bb) the words from “unless” to the end of that paragraph shall be omitted; and

(22) 2006 asp2.

(23) Rule 41.2 was inserted by S.S.1. 2003/26.

(24) Section 1(1A) was inserted by the Family Law (Scotland) Act 2006 (asp2).
7


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/asp/2006/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2003/26
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/asp/2006/2

Document Generated: 2023-05-25

Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(iii) in paragraph 3, for “five” there shall be substituted “two”;
(e) after Form F24 there shall be inserted the Form F24A set out in the Schedule to this Act
of Sederunt;
(f) Form F30 shall be omitted;
(g) inForm F31—
(1) in the heading in block capitals for “two years” there shall be substituted “one year”;

(i1) in paragraph 4(ii) of the directions for making application for the words, from “the
Sheriff Clerk” to the end of that paragraph there shall be substituted ““the Scottish
Court Service” or a completed fee exemption form*;

(iii) in Part B of paragraph 3 of Part 1—
(aa) for the heading there shall be substituted the following:—
“If you have ticked one or more of the boxes in Part A, you should go direct

to Part C. You should only complete Part B if you have not ticked any boxes
in Part A”;

(bb) in sub-paragraph (i), for “consider myself to be” there shall be substituted
“am”; and

(cc) in sub-paragraph (ii), for “considers himself or herself to be” there shall be
substituted “is”;

(dd) in sub-paragraph (iii), for “the Council Regulation” there shall be
substituted “Council Regulation (E.C.) No. 2201/2003 of 27th November
2003 concerning jurisdiction and the recognition and enforcement of
judgments in matrimonial matters and in matters of Parental Responsibility
(0.J. No L.338, 23.12.2003, p.1);

(iv) in Part C of paragraph 3 of Part 1, after sub-paragraph (ii) there shall be inserted—
i) Ilived an e adduess shoenr abwosee Ton ooperiod ol ol Tease ()
days caxchnnz wed mare Ui davs belvrs e dale 1 signed

(his applicuticn amd Tueee no koo residomges i Scotluml al
Meal. clale

{ivi My spouse Tived gl e aderess shown ghove Tora period ol al
Terigsd W) s eradimg nol inore i 4000 Teelrre Tre dile 1
sizned this applicagon and s oo koown eesidencs in
Seatlamad o hat e

(v) in paragraph 5 of Part 1, for “2 years” there shall be substituted “1 year”;

(vi) in paragraph 8 of Part 1, for the words from “Is” to “handicap?)” there shall be
substituted “Does your spouse have any mental disorder (whether mental illness,
personality disorder or learning disability)? (if yes, give details)”;

(vii) after paragraph 10 of Part 1 there shall be inserted the following:—
“(10A) REMARRIAGE
Is there any religious impediment to the remarriage of *[ YES/NO]
you or your spouse? (if yes, give details)”;
(viii) in the heading to Part 2, for “two years” there shall be substituted “one year”;

(ix) in the first paragraph of Part 2, for “two years” there shall be substituted “one year”;
and



Document Generated: 2023-05-25
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(x) in paragraph (b) of the statement of consent, for “two years” there shall be substituted
“one year”;

(h) in Form F33—
(i) in the heading in block capitals for “five” there shall be substituted “two”;

(ii) in paragraph 3(ii) of the directions for making application, for the words from “the
Sheriff Clerk” to the end of that paragraph there shall be substituted ““the Scottish
Court Service” or a completed fee exemption form*;

(iii) in Part B of paragraph 5 of Part 1—
(aa) for the heading there shall be substituted—

“If you have ticked one or more of the boxes in Part A, you should go direct
to Part C. You should only complete Part B if you have not ticked any boxes
in Part A”;

(bb) in sub-paragraph (i), for “consider myself to be” there shall be substituted
“am”; and

(cc) in sub-paragraph (ii), for “considers himself or herself to be” there shall be
substituted “is”;

(dd) in sub-paragraph (iii), for “the Council Regulation” there shall be
substituted “Council Regulation (E.C.) No. 2201/2003 of 27th November
2003 concerning jurisdiction and the recognition and enforcement of
judgments in matrimonial matters and in matters of Parental Responsibility
(0.J. No L.338, 23.12.2003, p.1)”;

(iv) in Part C of paragraph 5 of Part 1, after sub-paragraph (ii) there shall be inserted—

() I lived al e addoess shoen abeve fog a period of ad ease 400
Laya crwling not more man He Qs ws Telves e dale T gignsd
hiz applicamen ad have o kowo residenes i scotland al
[, cLake

v My spouse Tved ol (e wddress shosen gl Tora period of
al Teaal 90 diws cmdingg vl s han S0 iy helome thi
dlale Tsignzd (s applicaiion ancl s o known residenes in
Seotland at T e

(v) in paragraph 7(i) of Part 1 for “5” there shall be substituted “2”;

(vi) in paragraph 9 of Part 1, for the words from “Is” until “handicap?)” there shall be
substituted “Does your spouse have any mental disorder (whether mental illness,
personality disorder or learning disability)? (if yes, give details)”;

(vii) after paragraph 11 there shall be inserted the following:—
“11A. REMARRIAGE
Is there any religious impediment to the remarriage of *[ YES/NO]
you or your spouse? (if yes, give details)”;
(viii) in paragraph 12, the words from “I believe” to “application” shall be omitted*;

(i) after Form F33 there shall be inserted the Form F33A set out in the Schedule to this Act
of Sederunt;

(j) in Form F34—



Document Generated: 2023-05-25

Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(i) in the heading in block capitals for “two years” there shall be substituted “one year”;
(i1) in the first paragraph, for “two years” there shall be substituted “one year” and
(iii) paragraph 1(b) shall be omitted;
(k) in Form F35—
(1) in the heading in block capitals for “five” there shall be substituted “two”;
(i1) in the first paragraph, for “five” there shall be substituted “two”’; and
(iii) paragraph 1(b) shall be omitted;

(1) after Form F35 there shall be inserted the Form F35A set out in the Schedule to this Act
of Sederunt;

(m) in paragraph 1(a) of Form CP20, for “two years” there shall be substituted “one year”;
(n) in paragraph 1(a) of Form CP22, for “two years” there shall be substituted “one year”;
(o) in Form CP24—

(i) in the heading, for “five” there shall be substituted “two”; and
(ii) in paragraph 1—
(aa) for “five” there shall be substituted “two”’; and
(bb) the words from “unless” to the end of that paragraph shall be omitted.
(p) in Form CP25—
(1) in the heading, for “five” there shall be substituted “two”;
(i1) in paragraph 1 for “five” there shall be substituted “two”’; and
(iii) in paragraph 3, for “five” there shall be substituted “two”;

(q) after Form CP25 there shall be inserted the Form CP25A set out in the Schedule to this
Act of Sederunt;

(r) Form CP28 shall be omitted,
(s) in Form CP29—
(1) in the heading in block capitals, for “two years” there shall be substituted “one year”;

(i1) in paragraph 4(ii) of the directions for making application, for “sheriff clerk” there
shall be substituted “Scottish Court Service”;

(iii) in paragraph 5(i) of Part 1, for “2 years” there shall be substituted “1 year”;

(iv) in paragraph 8 of Part 1, for the words from “Is” to “handicap)?” there shall be
substituted “Does your civil partner have any mental disorder (whether mental
illness, personality disorder or learning disability)?”;

(v) in the heading in block capitals in Part 2, for “two years” there shall be substituted
“one year”;

(vi) in the first paragraph of Part 2, for “two years” there shall be substituted “one year”

(vii) in paragraph (b) of the statement of consent, for “two years” there shall be substituted
“one year”;

(t) in Form CP30—
(i) in the heading in block capitals, for “five” there shall be substituted “two”;

(i1) in paragraph 3(ii) of the directions for making application, for the words from “the
Sheriff Clerk” to the end of that paragraph there shall be substituted ““the Scottish
Court Service” or a completed fee exemption form*;

(iii) in paragraph 7(i) of Part 1 for “5” there shall be substituted “2”;

10



Document Generated: 2023-05-25

Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(u)

v)

(W)

(x)

(iv) in paragraph 9 of Part 1, for the words from “Is” to “handicap)?” there shall be
substituted “Does your civil partner have any mental disorder (whether mental
illness, personality disorder or learning disability)? *;

(v) in paragraph 12 of Part 1, the words from “I believe” to “application” shall be
omitted;

in Form CP31—

(i) in paragraph 3(ii) of the directions for making application, for the words from “the
Sheriff Clerk” to the end of that paragraph there shall be substituted ““the Scottish
Court Service” or a completed fee exemption form*;

(i1) in paragraph 8 of Part 1, for the words from “Is” to “handicap)?” there shall be
substituted “Does your civil partner have any mental disorder (whether mental
illness, personality disorder or learning disability)?”;

in Form CP32—

(i) in the heading in block capitals for “two years” there shall be substituted “one year”;
and

(i1) in the paragraph beginning “Your civil partner”, for “two years” there shall be
substituted “one year”;

in Form CP33—
(1) in the heading in block capitals for “five” there shall be substituted “two”;
(i1) in the first paragraph for “five” there shall be substituted “two”’; and
(iii) paragraph 1(b) shall be omitted;

after Form CP37 there shall be inserted the Form CO1 set out in the Schedule to this Act
of Sederunt.

Edinburgh BRIAN GILL
12th April 2006 Lord Justice Clerk, I.P.D.

11



Document Generated: 2023-05-25
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCHEDULE Rule 2(60)

FORM F24AForm of notice to defender in action of divorce where an interim gender
recognition certificate has been issued
Rule 33.14(1)(c)

TOU ARE GIVEN NOTICE thie—

Lo e copry andtial sseril acrved omoyom ogciher sth s wotics staics thal, s iierime gemder
rocoamima coriilficats has been wswed 6 yow [or the pursucr]. W ths pursaer catabhishes s as a
Figet, Jeiree will be gramed,

2. Trecree ol diverre will cnd e mamiags Merchy allocing aoy mighn e duch pengion as may
depend cdr the marmze eondinwing, o1 on yoor being el a widoss The siee wdoss s pension sl
ol be pavablde 1o yow when e pursucr dics. Yow inay alao ose vour tizhls ol succcasdon o Lhe
ursuer’ s estale,

Fo0 U the puesuer s cnttled tooa decees of divoree, vou ace neverthalass cotitled to apply o the
shoeritt in this action—
{ar weaake fnoicial or cdher provedsion Tor sou wder e amly Lase Dseollad p Act 1955,
{1 dor gn order under seetion Dol the Children iScolandd Act 1995 00 respect ol any
child of the meuriage, of doy child scespted as such, who s under 10 seas of aee; o
(¢} for any competent oder,

4. IF YOU WISH TO APPLY FOR ANY OF THE ABOVE ORDERS you should consull o
selicitior with o view to ledging o netles of utention e defend (oo 192600

[dalz fingerl dakey I5igmed)
soligitor e e pursoer Grhd designation and

mrsiness addmess)

FORM F33AForm of simplified divorce application under section 1(1)(b) of the Divorce
(Scotland) Act 1976

12



Document Generated: 2023-05-25
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

Rule 33.74(1)(3)

Shentf Clatls

Sheril T Clorl. Hoyug

CTelephonei. oo o

APPLICATION  FOR THVORCE (INTERIM GENDER S RECOQONTITON . CERTTTITCA
P DT TTOOXN GO THE PARTIES AFTER TTHE MARRTIAGTH

Lelore conplotimg dats Torm. vou showld have vead tie lealler enwalled “Dee i vouwrse 5 DHvree™,
which explaing e cirownalainees in whicl a divorce may be sought by s oethead. 10 e
sinplificd procedwe appears o suil yowr ClrcwmisLnees, you may uss s fomn wooapply e
divire helow o will fud direcions designed Wk dsstal yinn w1l sour apphicaien, Pl
FERlow thome carclully,  Toohg evenl of Qiticuliy, yon 1dy eonaet any shoerill” clork™s olfice o
Citiacn®s Adyice FHorcan.

Directinns fur making application

WERITE I INE, TISING BLOCKE CAPTTALS

Applicatica 1. Complele and sign Pare 1 of Lie Foam (pages 3-75 paying particular

iPan 1) atlnuent do he nales opposile cach seclion.

AdTluvils 2, When you huye completed Parl 1, you should take the Turm o g Jusiice ol

{Purt ) e Peace, Notiry Public, Commissioner for Craths oo other duly authorised
prersen ser that vour affidait ae Part 2 (pape 8) may be completad wnd sworn.

RewnTing 3 When Jdirecions 1-2 gbove lave begn counplied with, your applicadon Is

connplited o reads o be sent e the sheriff clerk at the ahiovee address. Wirh it voa

application oSt cnelos::

form to conrt
(v wour muurinee cortificats {the dooament headed "Exteact of anocntry o
a Roegisler of Marmases”, wiuch will be retumiad 1o o in doe course).,
Chheck the nedes ona page 2 0o see i85 vou also need Lo obtadn a leier Gean
the Ganeral Wagisier OTes stanng hal theee is ne recend Hial veur
spotse has divoreed v, and.

ik cithor a choegue or poacal order inrespoct of 1he courl, fes, crossed aind
nade payatde o “Secitush Cowrt Sorvice™ o a coampleled Tee cxengilicn
form, ancl

(11 i imlerimm goemde recosniticn cerificates or o comy scaled with 1the seil
L0 1hs: Cremdor Revogmiition Pymcls qmed comlilieed (o be o o copy ey an
aicer Juiherised b e Prosident of Cender Becogmition Pangls,

4, Regeipl ol vour apmlication will be pronpily scknowledped, Shuould you

il o witlaleea e applicativn for any regson, plesse contaen e sheril T
cledk immediarely,

13



Document Generated: 2023-05-25
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

PART1
WRITE IN INK, LSING RTOCK CAPITALS
L NAME AR ADDRESS OF APPLICANT

L] LT VAT R LY 1 SRS TR TSR

2, NAMI Q1 51PO0SL-
B

L] T TN N T Y SRS TR TSRS

3ADTIRESS OF STROLST O the wddreys ol oo sprase 14 tiol ks please @iy “nol kisn™
i s prarsgraph und proceesd (o paragrant 4

e L O T SRS

et elephoma ruimiDeT G5 ame o s

4. Only complets this paralraph 10 sou do oot know the present gddress ol your e

MEXT-OF-KIM

L O USSR
AIEES i e e e e e
Lo Bt Een IS IIIEY B0 FEIIE SIS oot ot et ce e e et ee et et et e et e ke n s e et e et n s e

14



Document Generated: 2023-05-25
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

CHULIIRLE O THLE MARRIALLE

Names and dutes of Tirth Addrosses

M imeulicient space s availalle o st gl D children ol the mamige, plewse conlinug on g
seprite shoet wad attach to this forn

2O TURISINCTION
Ploase indicate witl 2 tick () 1 the appropreace hox o boxes which of te following apply:

PART A
1 My spouse and Toce habimally resideot in Scodaod

1y My sponse mud [were Tast habitually residen in Sconland, and
o o s sl resides e

gy Wy ospouse s babilually resident it Scallang

civd o Dum habitally resident in Seanlamd haing residhed e e al
Tyl o sour inmnrsadiaiely boerome this apprication was 1

vy Tam habimally resident in Scotand having resided theee for at
lewist six mondbe inposdiately elore Uiy applicition wis meds
anel gin clomicilesd in Senyland

Gvny o My spowse wnd L are demiciled in Scotlad

If yon have ticked ane or more of the boxes in Part A, you should go divect to Part C, You
should nnly complete Part B iF you have not Heleed any of the hoxes in Port A

15



Document Generated: 2023-05-25
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

rART B
§] [ am depnicilad o Seotland
(i) My speim 1y dummcilod i Seol Tl
AN
) Boor cowrl of & Conlracling Slale has junadcuen uder Councl
Fogudaem (18000 Boc 2201200075 of 27h tovember 2003
concermng jurtacicion and e recogition ard colorceneil
of judgivicnts o malemenal wiadlers aud mallers of pareolal
rosponsibiliny (00, Mo, 1., 338 23,1 22003 pa
PARTC
i I havec Livoed ot the addeess shomwan abosee for ac Least S days
ioumediately befors the date T sipned dus applicitiog
) by apose has hved wn the adedeess slivvear aboree For ad least
A0 days wmomedialely helore he dale U signed s application
Liii) Tivasd al the weilress shoman aboeee Tor g peniod ol wl Teas) 4
davys ending not mere than 40 davs before the date I signed

thix application wd have no Lo residencs in Scotland at
il odute

Y My spause lved at the address shown above for a period of at
Least 40 davs coding oot oore than 0 days betoas the doee 1
siencd Whis applicalion and has 10 ke resaidence o
Seoland ac thal dave

G IMTTALILS OF FRIESENLT MARRLACH

Place of Martiape .. Repistracion District)
Dl o Marriage: Ry, o, TREIR, LA

ToOIMITALLS OF ISSULE O INTHRIM GUEN R RECOGNITION CHR T AL

(i Plewse state whother the inienim gender recognion cartificare has bean issued e you
LT WILIT ST
(7 s statss e dabia (s mlemirn enghar rocogn o Gerld Nicale ws issuod

Ravo o Memthe Year oo

16



Document Generated: 2023-05-25
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

$, MENTAL DISORDER

Thoess wour spouse have any mental disorder fwhether *[YFSMY]
mentul ilaess, persanality disorder o learmng disabilies ) *
It vos, pive details)

4. CHILIM{EN
Are there aow children of the mooriage under the age of 167 *YLSMO

1IN OTHER COURT ACTIONS
Are you aveare of oy courl acticns curenly prowecding 1 Y LS
any conmry (ingluding Scotland which may alTect your
mgrmiage? (0 vos, give dolpilss
# 1 aslele ag appacpriale

11, DECLARATION AND REQUEST FOR DIVORCE

[eomliren that the Gacts st bed n puragraphs T- 10 absres apply ity o mmigss,
Loy NE¥L ask the sherifl we mmake any linancial prosision in cotauec lion willy this apphcation.

[ request the sheritt to grant decree of divoree trom my lusband or wife,

[ STLITE Ol APTITRUTIL, s v i e s

PART 2

APPLICARN TS ALDLUIAYIL

Toy be completad by the Applicant only affer Part 1 has been signad and dated.

L (oot ARG Ioaat's Fell iREY e e

rogiding oL (Ersare e s re s e BerH e T rENS b e

SWEAR Ml o e eyt of my Eneeslodss and behicl the racls statad i P Dol s Applicaln
e T,

SUEIEILTC O APTHLCATIL oo e ettt ettt e et mhm et e e ee s men e et mem s e s e mce e

17



Document Generated: 2023-05-25
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SWIOIEMN AL TERXPFT D L e e e+ e
Tor I connpleted by

Justice ol he Peace,

: : s day ol e
Moty Pulivc or
L poumussLone for P00 102 CEAENTE TR FEIE oot
Oty
CERe B Bl GfillF B R L e
S IETIELLITE st ettt e e e et m e e m e et e e e

Flnsnies of the Peace! Motary Puhlic/AC onimissioner o Ouaths

& Dol s appropriate

FORM 35AForm of citation in application on grounds under section 1(1)(b) of the Divorce
(Scotland) Act 1976

18



Document Generated: 2023-05-25
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

Rule 33.76(3)(c)

(fasert pamle urd audlFexs of Ror-applicant spouse)
APPLICATTION  FOR THYORCE (INTEREIM CrENDER S RECOONTTTON  CERTTETCAT-
(S UEIFTTOONE OF THE PARTIES AFTEIRTHE MARRIACH)
Yowr spowse las applice wa the sheed foo desees an tie growned ihat an interom aender cecegiition
corHECA Tas b iagued 1o oo or somr Spongae 2107 pour T,
Aocopy of the application 15 hareby served apan vou,
U Tlegse nole thad the sherilT mgy nol make lnancigl prosision under thiy procedure wncd thil
WU S[HHIE I |r1ukir1_-::_ 1 lann lor—

(up the pavment by yen of o pericdical allowanes (ue. o ceoular payment of money weeldy

or monthly, ete, for puintenance}:
(R e paymiend Ty wow ol a capital so (e, a Ty suin payrmcnl).

2 Dnvorce may tosull i the loss lee yom cF properly tighls (og the vighl o swecesd 10 e
Aqplicant’s esiale o his or bee deathr or Uz rigle, whene appropriale. W ponsion.

3 It vou wish w0 oppose the prontiog of o decree of diveres, v should put vour easons o
witing awnd sead woue ket too the address showo below, Tour Letter must reach the sheritt eleds
belvae iiverd daret.

A, In the event ol (he decree of Jivoree being gramied, you will be senl o copy ol the eximgl
decree, Should won chanpe vour address hefore roceiving the copy extract decres, please ootity
the shertt clerk immediately,

i%pped)
Sheritt cleds {deputer

irrwert ddedrasy ond oolepboie aomber o the
sheariff clerk)

Leor SherilT i Tiser|

NOTE: If weu wish to exercise vomw cight to make a claim for finaocial provisien yon shouold
immediie]y advise the sheridl clerk thal you oppose e applicalion Lor til reason. and diersalier
consull i solicilor,

FORM CP25AForm of notice to defender in action of dissolution of civil partnership where an
interim gender recognition certificate has been issued

19



Document Generated: 2023-05-25
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

Rule 33A.14(1)(c)

YO ARF GIVEN NOTICE Lhyl—

1. 'Uhe copy nnhal writ aoeved on vou wogether with Unis neiee swakes (hat an inderim gender
revoenilion cerlificals s boeen issued 6 vou [or e pursuger], W0 pursoct cslablishes his as g
Fact, e will by gramiid,

2 Deeree of dissoluton will sl the cvil parmership herchy allfectmg oy right o swel ponson
a5 Ty depend e the avil parierslip condinuing oo your tigh e any glale penssm il may have
Beenn payable 1o you on e death of vour cral parier. Yoo may also lose your mzhts of
SLICCCRRH 10 e parsuer’s cslale.

001t the pursuer 12 cooled o decres of dissoluton von are nevertheless cotitled w apply oo the
shoritt in this action—
Ak e neke Gmcial or clher prevasion [or sou mder e Fondly Fase 15eollady Act 1955,

{2y lor w order under secton 11 of the Children (Scotland} Ao 1995 in respect ol wy
chuld of the family witdun the meaning of scenon W7 of the Ciwl Partnersbipy Ace
2004, ar

W ot ymy wibior coanpuienl urdr,

A YO WISH 1O APPLY FOE ANY O THED ABROVLE ORDERS wou sboald comsull a
selicilor wilh a view 10 ldzing aeoce of wilenion w delond (o TR

IDale tirwer! claie) [Signed)
Soligilor e the pursusr (ogd

elesd grition and Buiiaaoes oddraga

FORM COl1Form of intimation of application for financial provision on intestacy under
section 29(2) of the Family Law (Scotland) Act 2006

20



Document Generated: 2023-05-25
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

Rule 33B.2(2)(b)

Taor finsert e wnd addeess da Lo wersant ) ot ret oo,

You ars given NOTICE that e purswcr has apphied for anoorder Doe mancial paesisen on
inleslagy under seclion 29020 o e Family Daw (aootlandh Acl 20005 A copy ol the iniliyl wal i
attiched, 15 you wish ooappeur s o party, you mus) lodge o ominuke with the shed T olers (rser
cictere s o sRerff clecf Nom lenve o dooso, Your minuke st by Todeed within 21 davs ol (irer
deite R which infienariog £ given. N B rale 5 302) relating to posted senvice or iRtiuiation ],

Xl {Lsert ) isizned)

Soliciter for the pursner

NOTL

T vou Jeinle b Tod e oo minule i ey be inoyour best injerests L consall asolicilor The mimie
should ez Todgedd with e sherinl clerk togeler with the appropridle lee ol 4faeend aarpund and o
copof this Intimation.

IFYOU ARE UNCERTAIN WHA'L ACTION 1O TAKL: wou shoul] consull a solicii,
Yo Ay he cnliled we lezxal add depending oa wour lnmicial arcwmisianees, aned yow cat gL
indonrgli aboul Regal gid Trom g scliciter,. You ey also obiain adyvice Tan any Cilieeng

Aalvive Bureiu or olther advice sgency,

EXPLANATORY NOTE
(This note is not part of the Act of Sederunt)

This Act of Sederunt amends Chapters 33 and 33A of the Ordinary Cause Rules in relation to
family actions and civil partnership actions in consequence of the provisions of the Family Law
(Scotland) Act 2006. In particular, provision is made to extend the application of the rules to actions
of declarator of marriage and declarator of nullity of marriage which may now be brought in the
sheriff court. Consequential amendments are also made in respect of the reduction in the separation
periods for divorce. A new Chapter 33B is inserted into the rules to make provision for applications
under sections 28 and 29 of the Family Law (Scotland) Act 2006 in relation to orders for financial
provision where cohabitation ends otherwise than by death and on intestacy. Additionally, various
minor amendments are made to Chapters 33 and 33A.

Consequential and miscellaneous amendments are also made to the forms set out in the Schedule
to the rules.
21



Document Generated: 2023-05-25
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

22



