
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2000 No. 451

The Producer Responsibility Obligations (Packaging
Waste) Amendment (Scotland) Regulations 2000

Amendment of the Producer Responsibility Obligations (Packaging Waste) Regulations 1997

5. In Schedule 2 (recovery and recycling obligations)–
(a) in paragraph 4(c), for “52%” substitute “56%”; and
(b) in paragraph 5(c), for “16%” substitute “18%”.


