Draft Legislation: This is a draft item of legislation. This draft has since been made as a Scottish
Statutory Instrument: The Budget (Scotland) Act 2010 Amendment (No. 2) Order 2010 No. 445

Draft Order laid before the Scottish Parliament under section 7(2) of the Budget (Scotland) Act
2010, for approval by resolution of the Scottish Parliament.

DRAFT SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2010 No.
PUBLIC FINANCE AND ACCOUNTABILITY

The Budget (Scotland) Act 2010
Amendment (No. 2) Order 2010

Made - - - - 2010

Coming into force in accordance with article 1

The Scottish Ministers make the following Order in exercise of the powers conferred by section 7(1)
of the Budget (Scotland) Act 2010(1) and all other powers enabling them to do so.

In accordance with section 7(2) of that Act, a draft of this Order has been laid before and approved
by resolution of the Scottish Parliament.

Citation, commencement and interpretation

1.—(1) This Order may be cited as the Budget (Scotland) Act 2010 Amendment (No. 2) Order
2010 and comes into force on the day after the day on which it is made.

(2) In this Order, “the 2010 Act” means the Budget (Scotland) Act 2010.

Amendment of section 3 of the 2010 Act

2.—(1) Section 3 of the 2010 Act (overall cash authorisations) is amended in accordance with
paragraphs (2) to (5).

(2) In paragraph (a) (in relation to the Scottish Administration)(2), for “£31,022,875,000”
substitute “£31,800,947,000”.

(3) In paragraph (b) (in relation to the Forestry Commissioners), for “£79,900,000” substitute
“£79,946,000”.

(4) Inparagraph (d) (in relation to the Scottish Parliamentary Corporate Body), for “£78,554,000”
substitute “£78,721,000”.

(5) In paragraph (e) (in relation to Audit Scotland), for “£6,673,000” substitute “£6,919,000”.

(1) 2010 asp 4, as amended by S.S.I. 2010/282.
(2) Paragraph (a) was amended by S.S.1. 2010/282, article 2(2).


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/asp/2010/4
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2010/282
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2010/282

Document Generated: 2023-05-10
Draft Legislation: This is a draft item of legislation. This draft has since been made as a Scottish
Statutory Instrument: The Budget (Scotland) Act 2010 Amendment (No. 2) Order 2010 No. 445

Amendment of schedule 1 to the 2010 Act

3.—(1) Schedule 1 to the 2010 Act (the Scottish Administration) is amended in accordance with
paragraphs (2) to (4).

(2) In column 1 (purposes)—

(a) in the third purpose, for “Home Insulation Scheme” substitute “Home Insulation
Schemes”; and

(b) in the sixth purpose, omit “and the Water Industry Commission for Scotland”.

(3) In column 2 (amount of resources other than accruing resources)—
(a) in relation to the second purpose, for “£2,472,968,000” substitute “£2,494,403,000”;
(b) in relation to the third purpose, for “£12,179,042,000” substitute “£12,155,963,000”;
(c) in relation to the fourth purpose, for “£2,806,071,000” substitute “£2,917,773,0007;
(d) in relation to the fifth purpose, for “£1,931,429,000” substitute “£1,897,168,000”;
(e) in relation to the sixth purpose, for “£511,056,000” substitute “£517,949,000”;
(f) in relation to the eighth purpose, for “£118,905,000” substitute “£119,305,000”;
(g) in relation to the ninth purpose, for “£10,524,385,000” substitute “£10,531,596,0007;
(h) in relation to the tenth purpose, for “£22,045,000” substitute “£28,316,000”;
(1) in relation to the eleventh purpose, for “£10,126,000” substitute “£10,201,000”;
(j) in relation to the twelfth purpose, for “£2,516,320,000” substitute “£3,230,367,000”;
(k) in relation to the thirteenth purpose, for “£3,647,000” substitute “£3,447,000”;
(1) in relation to the fourteenth purpose, for “£85,942,000” substitute “£93,494,000’; and

(m) in relation to the total of amounts of resources, for “£33,712,215,000” substitute
“£34,530,346,000”.

(4) In column 3 (amount of accruing resources)—
(a) in relation to the second purpose, for “£192,000,000” substitute “£204,000,000”;
(b) in relation to the fourth purpose, for “£143,000,000” substitute “£144,700,000”;
(c) in relation to the sixth purpose, for “£590,300,000 substitute “£633,100,000”;
(d) in relation to the eighth purpose, for “£600,000” substitute “£1,000,000”;
(e) in relation to the tenth purpose, for “£5,600,000” substitute “£6,600,000”;
(f) in relation to the twelfth purpose, for “£1,476,400,000” substitute “£1,675,000,0007;
(g) in relation to the fourteenth purpose, for “£20,000,000” substitute “£40,000,000”; and

(h) in relation to the total of amounts of resources, for “£4,566,800,000” substitute
“£4,843,300,000”.

Amendment of schedule 2 to the 2010 Act

4.—(1) Schedule 2 to the 2010 Act (direct-funded bodies) is amended in accordance with
paragraph (2).
(2) In column 2 (amount of resources other than accruing resources)—
(a) in relation to the first purpose, for “£80,000,000” substitute “£80,046,000”;
(b) in relation to the third purpose, for “£91,304,000” substitute “£91,471,000’; and
(c) in relation to the fourth purpose, for “£7,349,000” substitute “£7,595,000”.



Document Generated: 2023-05-10
Draft Legislation: This is a draft item of legislation. This draft has since been made as a Scottish
Statutory Instrument: The Budget (Scotland) Act 2010 Amendment (No. 2) Order 2010 No. 445

St Andrew's House,
Edinburgh A member of the Scottish Executive



Document Generated: 2023-05-10
Draft Legislation: This is a draft item of legislation. This draft has since been made as a Scottish
Statutory Instrument: The Budget (Scotland) Act 2010 Amendment (No. 2) Order 2010 No. 445

EXPLANATORY NOTE

(This note is not part of the Order)

This Order amends the Budget (Scotland) Act 2010 (“the 2010 Act”).
This Order amends the 2010 Act so as to—

(@)

(b)

(©

(d)

(e)

alter the overall cash authorisations in relation to the Scottish Administration, the
Forestry Commissioners, the Scottish Parliamentary Corporate Body and Audit Scotland
in section 3 of the 2010 Act (article 2);

alter the third and sixth purposes for which resources may be used in accordance with
section 1 of and schedule 1 to the 2010 Act (article 3(2));

alter the amount of resources other than accruing resources that may be used for certain
of the purposes set out in schedule 1 to the 2010 Act and the total of amounts of resources
for all of the purposes (article 3(3));

alter the amount of accruing resources in respect of certain of the purposes set out in
schedule 1 to the 2010 Act and the total of amounts of resources for all of the purposes
(article 3(4)); and

alter the amount of resources other than accruing resources of direct-funded bodies in
schedule 2 to the 2010 Act in relation to the first, third and fourth purposes (article 4(2)).



