Rules 105

“(a) the notice has been served upon such party fifteen
clear days at least before the relevant return day;”’;

(¢) in Rule 12, the words “and the date and description of all
documents used in evidence at the hearing” shall be
omitted.

County Court Rules (Northern Ireland), 1957
1957. No. 63 [C]

" "'We, the undersigned members of the County Court Rules
Committee .duly appointed under sub-section (4) of section
eighteen of the County Courts Act (Nerthern Ireland), 1955, do
by virtue of the powers vested in us in this behalf hereby—

(a¢) make the several Rules in Part I of the Schedule set forth
as Rules to be in force in proceedings in the County Courts
under the provisions of the said Act in that Part respec-
tively specified and such other statutory provision as
therein appears, and direct that the Forms in the Appendix
to that Part set forth shall have effect for the purposes
cf those Rules respectively

(b) make the amendment in Part IT of the Schedule set forth
in the Rules made the 12th day of July, 1858, under
‘Bection 64 of the Probates and Letters of Admlmstratlon

- Act (Ireland), 1857,

. (¢) make the Aamendments (including additions) in Part IIT of
the Schedule set forth in the County :Courts (Ireland)
Orders, 1890,

(d) make the amendment in Part IV of the Schedule set forth
in the County Court (Proceedings and- Actions before the
Registrar for Belfast) Rules, 1948, and

(e) make the amendment in Part V of the Schedule set forth
in the Marriages of Minors (Northern Ireland) County
Court Rules, 1954,

and do hereby certify the same under our hands and submit

them to the Lord Chief Justice acecordingly.

Bernard J. Fox
Wm. Johnson

J. G. Agnew
Charles Stewart
Turlough O’Donnell
James J. Napier
John L. Pinkerton
T. F. Glass

J. F. Caldwell

* 1 approve these Rules which shall eome into force on the
first day of May, 1957.

Dated the 6th day of April, 1957.

MacDermott, .
Liord Chief Justice of Northern Ireland.




108 COUNTY COURTS

SCHEDULE
Part I

RULES FOR THE PURPOSES OF CERTAIN PROVISIONS OF THE
CouNTYy COURTS ACT (NORTHERN IRELAND), 1955, AND
CERTAIN OTHER STATUTORY PROVISIONS

1. Construction of Deeds, Wills, ete.

Rules made under Section 10 of the County Court Amendment
(Ireland) Act, 1882, as amended by Sectzon 6 of the County
Courts Act (Northern Ireland), 1955

- 1. An application by any person claiming to be interested
under a deed, will or other written instrument, for the deter-
mination of any question of construction arising thereunder and
for a declaration of the rights of any . person 1nterested shall
be brought by equity civil b111

2. The civil bill may be in the form A in the Appendix-and,
subject .to the provisions of Rule 3, shall be served on every
person appearing to the plaintiff to ‘have an interest in the
question sought to be determined. :

3. The Judge at the hearing shall have power—

(a) to dispense with service of the civil bill on such
persons as he may think fit;

(b) to appoint some one or more than one person to
represent a class;

(c) to direct service of the civil bill on any person not
served therewith and appearing to him to have an
interest in the said question.

4. The apphcatlon shall be supported by such evidence as
the Judge may require.

5, Where not otherwise -expressly provided by these Rules the
rules and practice for the time being in force in the county court
applicable to civil bills in equity suits shall apply to all such
applications as aforesaid.

2. 'Third Party Procedure

Rules made under Section 10 of the County Courts Act (Northern
Ireland), 1955 °

1.—(1) Where a defendant claims to be entitled to any
contribution, indemnity or other relief over against any person
not a party to the action (in these Rules referred to as a “ third
party ”’), he may, not later than ten clear days before the return
day, serve on the third party in like manner as a civil bill a third
party notice in the form B in the Appendix, together with a
copy of the civil bill in the action.

(2) A third party notice may be served at any place in
Northern Ireland.

2. When the third party notice has been served under Rule 1
a copy thereof shall forthwith be delivered to the plaintiff by



Rules . 107

post or otherwise and a copy thereof lodged. with the Clerk of
the Crown and Peace.

3. Subject to any order of thé Judge, the notlce shall have
effect as if it were a civil blll served by the defendant on the
_Athlrd party. :

4. TheJ udge at the trial—

(@) may give such directions or make such order as he
© may think appropriate for determlmng the issues
between the parties; and

(b) may pronounce such decree or judgment as the nature
of the case may require.

5. The foregoing Rules and Rule 2 of Order VIII.of the County'
Courts (Ireland) Orders, 1890, shall apply mutatis mutandis
where—

(a) a defendant claims to be entitled to any contrlbutlon,
indemnity or other relief over against any other
" defendant: provided that a third party notice served
on a defendant need not be accompanied by a copy

of the civil bill; :

“(b) a third party claims to be entitled to any contribution
indemnity or other relief over against another person
“not a patrty to the action (who may be known as.a
“fourth party ”); and
(¢) a fourth party or any subsequent party in liké case
makes a like claim agamst a person, not a party to
the action.

- 3. Judgment Mortgage

Riiles made under Section 13 -of the ‘County C’ourts Act ( Northern
Ireland), 1955

1. An affidavit for the purpose of reglsteung as a mortgage
.any such judgment, decree or order as is referred te in settion 13
of the County Courts Act (Northern Ireland), 1955 (in these Rules
referred to as “ the decree ”), shall be ﬁled in the office of the
Clerk of the Crown and Peace for the county or county borough
mt Winch the lands, tenements or heredltaments affected are
situate .

2.  Where the 1ands, tenements or hereditaments affected——

(d) are situate within the jurisdiction of the court by
which the decree was given or made, the Clerk of the
Crown and Peace concerried shall endorse on the copy
afﬁdawtt referred to'in Rule 4 a certificate as to the
amount—

(1) of money and costs awarded by the decree; and

(ii) .of any set-off or counterclaim allowed;
(b) are not so situate, the Clerk of the Crown and Peace
for the county or county borough in which the decree
was given or made shall, at the request of the party



108 ' COUNTY COURTS

desirous of filing the affidavit, issue to him a certificate
in the form C in the Appendix, which certificate shall
be filed with the affidavit.

3. The Llerk of the Crown and Peace shall mamtam an index
or affidavits filed in his office under these Rules, and that index

and all such affidavits shall be open to inspection durmg ofﬁce
hours.

4. The solicitor or party ﬁlmg an afﬁdamt under these Rules
shall lodge with the Clerk of the Crown and Peace a true copy
thereof, to be compared in the office of and certified by the Clerk
of the Crown and Peace.

5. The said solicitor or party shall thereupon proceed in like
manner a§ if the affidavit were a judgment mortgage affidavit filed
in the Central Office of the Supreme Court.

6. The Clerk of the Crown and:Peace in whose office an
affidavit has been filed under Rule 1, where he is satisfied that
the decree thereinh referred to has been paid or satisfied, shall
enter a memorandum to that effect in the index neferred to in
Rule 3 and shall on request issue a certificate in the.form D in
the Appendix, which shall be sealed or stamped with the seal of
the court and shall thereupon have the like effect gs if it were a
certificate of satisfaction issued out of the Central Office of the
Supreme Court.

4. Extension of Decrees, ete.

Rules made under Section 14 of the County Courts Act (Northern
Ireland), 1955

1. Every application toextend a decree or dismiss in pursuance
of section 14 of the County Courts Act (Northern Ireland), 1955
(in these Rules referred to as an “ application ”’) shall be made
to the Judge in open court upon notice to be served upon the

person against whom it is sought to extend such decree or
dismiss.

2. Every such notice shall—
(a) set forth particulars of the decree or dismiss;

" (b) set forth the amount due on foot thereof after all just
credits and allowances; and

(c¢) be subject to the like requlrements as an ordinary civil
bill with respect to the time for and mode of service,
and to entry, heéaring and determination.

3. The original decree or d1sm1ss {or a duplicate thereof)

shall be lodged with the notice in the office of the Clerk of the
Crown and Peace.

4—(1) At the hearing of an application the amount due on
foot of the decree or dismiss may be proved either by oral
ev1dence or by affidavit in form E 1n the Appendix.

(2). An affidavit under paragraph (1) shall be made by the
party who-has, or by one of the partiés who have, obtained the




Rules - 109

decree or dismiss; but where such party is unable to make such
affidavit, the Court may aecept an affidavit made on his behalf
by any person who in the opinion of the Court is competent to
depose to the matters stated. Such persons may include—
(@) any person in the employment of the plaintiff or
: defendant (as the case may be) having personal
knowledge of the matters stated, but not otherwise;
(b) in the case of a company, any such person as is
mentioned in Rule 9 of Order XXXVII of the County
Courts (Ireland) Orders, 1890; and
(¢) a legal persocnal representative of any deceased
plaintiff or defendant.

(3) Such afiidavit shall be sworn within the seven days
next preceding the entry day.

(4) The solicitor for the plaintiff or defendant, as the case
may be, shall at the foot of such affidavit certify that to the best
of his knowledge and belief the sum claimed therein is still
unpaid.

~ (B) BEvery such affidavit shall be filed in the office of the
Clerk of the Crown and Peace not later than the return day.

5. The Clerk 0f the Crown and Peace shall enter every
application in }he ordinary civil bill boek for hearing and shall
record the order of the Judge thereon. Where a decree or
dismiss is extended he shali endorse thereon the fact and date
of such extension, and shall sign such endorsement.

6. “An order for extension may be in form F' in the Appendix.

7 No civil bill precess shall be brought on any decree or
dismiss which. might be extended under the County Courts Act
(Northern Irelal_ad), 1955.

§. The Provisional Rules of 1st June, 1909, and 12th July, 1910,
respectively, are heréeby revoked. - ‘

5. Enforcement of Decrees, etc., throughout Northern Ireland

Rule made under Section 15 of the County Courts Act (Northern
Ireland), 1955

1. Where any person liable on foot of a decree or dismiss of
any county court—

(@) resides or has a place of business in some place outside
the jurisdiction of that court; or

(b) has or acquires in any place outside that jurisdiction
any property which may be taken in execution;

the party entitled to execution on foot of such decree or dismiss
may transmit it to the uidder-sheriff of the county in which any
sueh place is situate together with such a certificate as is
provided by seetion 12 6f the Civil Bill Courts Procedure Amend-
ment Act (Ireland), 1864; and it shall be the duty of that under-
sheriff to proceed to execution accordingly.



110 : COUNTY COURTS

6 Payment: mto Court  in Remitted Actions and Actlons
commenced by Ordinary Civil Bill :

Rules made under Section 18(2) (a) of the County Courts Act
(Northern Ireland), 1955

1—(1) Subject to paragraph (2) the succeedmg Rules shall
apply to the payment of money into court in remitted actions
and actions commenced by ordinary civil bill.

(2) These Rules shall not apply—

(a) to remitfed actions or actions commenced by
ordinary civil bill where the defence .is that of
tender before action brought;

(b) to actions for libel or slander;

(c) to actions in which the title to any corporeal or
incorporeal hereditaments comes in question.

2 —(1) Any defendant may at any time not less than six clear
days before entry day upon notice to the plaintiff in form G in
the Appendix pay into court such sum of money as he thinks
sufficient to satisfy the plaintiff’s claim together with the amount
of costs to which the plaintiff would have been entitled if, the
action had been settled for that sum before entry; and the
defendant shall at the time of such payment lodge with the
Clerk of the Crown and Peace a copy of such notice.

(2) Money paid into eourt shall remain in court subJect‘
to further order unless.the pl a1nt1ff elects to take it out as herein-
after provided. - . ) ’

. Where money is paid into court under Rule 2 the plaintiff
may at any time before entry day sign and serve on the defendant
and lodge with the Clerk of the Crown and Peace’'a notice (in
form H in the Appendix) accepting the amount in satlsfactlon of
his claim and costs.

4. Subject to Rule 5, where money is accepted under Rule 3
all proceedings in the action as between, the plaintiff and the
defendant who has paid the money into court shall be stayed,
and the money paid into court shall be paid out.to the plaintiff
without the neces51ty of any decree or order of the Court, and the
said defendant shall not be liable to any further costs

5.—(1) In any action in which a notice.of acceptance is served
under Rulé 3 by or on behalf of a plaintiff under legal disability

the money paid into court shall not be paid out Wlthout an order
of the Judge. : .

(2) Where notice of acceptance under Rule 3 1s served by
or on béhalf of a ‘plaintiff under legal disability a notice of
intention to apply to the Court for approval of such acceptance,
shall also be served on the defendart and lodged with the Clerk
of the:Crewn and Peace. Such application shall be made at the
time when.the action would, if no notice.of acceptance had been
served, have been heard by the J udge; and on the hearing of the’
apphcatlon ‘the Judge may  make such order as, to the costs
thereof as he may consider-just, '



‘ . Rules- 111

6. —(1) Where money has been paid into court by any
defendant under Rule 2 and the plaintiff (other than a plaintiff:
under legal disability) does not serve notice of acceptance under
Rule 3 and does not obtain judgment against that defendant for
an amount greater than that paid into court, he shall be liable
for the costs of that defendant.

(2). Where a defendant becomes entitled to costs under
this Rule such costs shall be paid to him out of the money paid
into court before any payment out of the said money is made -to
the plalntlff .

7. Where money has been pa1d into court under Rule 2 that
fact shall not-be communicated to the Judge before the deter-
mination of. all quest1ons of 11ab111ty and the amount of debt or
damages. .

8. Rules’2 to 7 shall apply mutatzs mutandzs in relation to
payment into court by a plaintiff to a counterclalm

. Hearmg of Acinons by . Ofﬁcers

Rules made under Section 18(2)(b)(iv) of the C‘ounty Courts Act
(Northern Ireland), 1955

1. The Judge may, subJect to Rule 2, from time to time—
(a) direct—

(i) that any actrons (1nclud1ng such actlons as are
referred to in Section 59 of the County Officers
and Courts (Ireland) Act, 1877) in which the
defendant fails to appear at the. hearmg or
‘admits the claim;

(ii) on the appllcatlon ‘of the parties, that any
action in which the sum claimed or the amount
involved does not exceed twenty pounds;

are or is to be .heard and determined by the- Clerk of
the Crown and Peace or Registrar (both of whom are
in these Rules included in the term. “ officer ”');

(b) give such consequential directions as may seem meet.

The hearing of an action by an officer is in these Rules referred
to as a “ delegated hearing . .

2. Notwithstanding Rule 1, an -officer shall not be' directed to
hear any proceedings under the Debtors (Ireland) Act, 1872,
or any civil bill to enforce a right to recover possession of goods
under the Hire Purchase Act (Northern Ireland), 1940.

'-3. . Where in the course of a delegated hearlng 1t appears to.
the officer that— '

(a) the action is not of. such kind as is referred to in
Rule 1; or

(b) by reason .of any special circumstances or difficulty the
action ought. properly to be heard.by. the Judge;
the oﬁ‘icer shall adlourn the case for hearlng by the Judge

4, At any delegdted hearmg the officer’ shall, subject to these’
Rules, have the like powers:as the Judge, ‘othér than the powers-



112 COUNTY COURTS )

conferted by sections 17 and 20 of the County Courts Act
(Northern: Ireland), 1955:

5-—(1) Any party dﬂSS&,tlSﬁed with the Judgment or order of
an officer (other than a judgment or order to whick all parties
have consented) may within four clear days of the proneunce-
ment thereof apply in writing (in the form J in the Appendix)
to the Clerk of the Crown and Peace to have the Judgment or
order reviewed by the Judge. Where such an apphcatlon is made
the Cletk of the Crown and Peace shall cause the case to be
brought before the Judge accordingly on the first convenient day
and shall duly notify the parties thereof.

2y On any such review (which shall bBe by way of re-
hearing) the Judge may give such judgment or make such order
- as he may think proper, or may direct a further delegated hearing
with such declarations or directions as he may think proper. .

6. Any decree or dismiss rmade by an officer shall be headed’
“By the Clerk of the Crown and Peace” or “ By the Registrar ”
as the case may be and, subject theréto and to Rule 5, every such-
decree and dismiss shall be drawn up and isswed and shall be.
enforced and enforceable in like manner gs if it had been grarnted
. by the Judge. . .

7. Inrespect of any proceedings heard by an oﬁicer there shall

. be payable— .- ,

(a) the same costs and court fees as if proceedings had
been Heard by the Judge; and

(b) where a judgment or order is reviewed under Rule 5,
such. further costs and court fees as shall be
prescribed.

8. These Rules shall not apply to any proceedings in the
Recorder’s Court for the City of Belfast.

8. Change of Venue to expedite hearing of Appeal

Rule made under Section 22 of the County Courts Act (Northem
Ireland), 1955 .
1. A party desirous—
(@) of appealing against any decree, dlSIIllSS or order of a
county court; and
(b) of having the hearing of his appeal expedlted

may apply to the Judge in court immediately after the pronourice
ment of the deeree, dismiss or order, for a certlﬁcate wh1ch may
be in the form XK in the Appendix.

APPENDIX
Forms here-inbefore referred to -

[The Forms in this Appendm: may be used in cases in. whzch they
are applzcable with such ovariations as circumstances may
require, but any suck varictions (nof being in matter o,'f
substance). shall not affect their validity] ,



Rules 113

ForM A—EQUITY CIVIL BILL FOR CONSTRUCTION

County of
Division of
Ih the Matter of (pm faculars o,r written, instriment)
BETWE‘EN : _
: AB: of (residencé and descrzptzon) o
. © Plaintift - -
. c D. of (residence and descnptzon) :
Defendant .

By THE -CouNT¥ COURT JUDGE "

The Plaintiff avers that
(State particulars. of -the written instrument) .

(State the z‘m‘erest of the ;’nlaintiﬁ‘ and def'endant under the
instrument)

{State the relevant provisions of the mstrument)

(State the circumstances under which the question has arzsen)

The personal estateé to- which the subject matter of this application
. relates does not exceed £1;000 in value and the annual value of
. thelands the subject matter of this application does not exceed £T75.

'THE PLAINTIFF AEPLIES FOR THE DETERMINATION BY THE COURT of the
following question(s) -

W DNk

THE DEFENDANT is therefore requlred to appear personally at the County

Court to he held at . . .in the Division and County aforesaid
on the day of 19 upon the hearing of the
plaintiff’s said apphcation . :

_Dated this day of 19

©_Sighed, ete.
Foru B—THIRD PARTY NOTICE ST
[Heading and thle as in Civil lel]
TAKE NoTICE thra,t this actlon has been: brought by the Plamtlﬁ a.galnst the

Defendant fOr,...ovseres veeee PRI and that the Defendant cla.lms agamsl;
you that—

[he is entitled to contrlbut]uon from you to the extent uf

...............................................

...........................................

[or other relief, if any, sought] ©oL ‘ ‘
‘The grounds of the Defendant’s claim are............... e ern e eiaaa

AND Tage Notice that if you dispute the Plaintiff’s claim against the
Defendant, or the Deféndant’s claim against you, you must appear at the
County Court to be held at - - .in the Division and County
aforesaid on the (date). when the Plamtlff’s claim against the Défendant and
the Defendants claim against you will be heard and determined.

dIn default of your appearing on the day of hearing you will be deemed to
admit—

( the vahdity of any Judgment obtamed in the actlon against the
= defendant; and

(b) your own Hability to contrlbutlon 1ndemn1ty or other relief to the
“éxtent herein, claimed.

Dated this . . -dayof . e L
To the Third Party, [Solicitor for] Defendant,
5




114 COUNTY COURTS ‘
FORM C—CERTIFICATE FOR JUDGMENT MORTGAGE AFFIDAVIT
LHeadmg and Title gs in Decree/Dismiss]

I A.B, Clerk of the Crown and Peace for the @bove-mentioned Court hereby
certify that at the [ 1 Sessions of that Court the [party] in.the
title hereof named obtained against the [party] likewise named a [decreel
[on a counterclaim] [dismiss] for the sum Of . .ccciviiiiiiiiiiiiniienann. Ttogether
with the sum of....coivvviiiieviiiiiiiiiiiiene 1 for. costs [miaking together the sum
(o) O O PPN 1.

(Slgnature)......,.,.,....,....,....A...., ......... (6 D1:177-) FO PN

ForM D—CERTIFICATE OF SATISFACTION
[Heading and Title as in Decreel

I A.B, Clerk of the Crown. and Peace for the above- mentmned Court hereby
certify-'that upon search being made in the index of.judgment mortgage
‘affidavits maintained in my office I.find that a memorandum was on the
(date) entered.to.the effect that the [judgment] [decree] [order] in ‘this
[action] [sult] [matter] was satisfied and discharged which I certify
vthis (date) - . .

SEaL T Clerk of the Crown and Peace

" ForM E-—AFFIDAVIT FOR EXTENSION OF DECREE/DISMISS
[Heading and Title as in Decree/Dismniss]

I, . of : in the County
of (here state the addition or occupation of the
person swearing), one of the parties [or personal representative of E.F., one
of the parties], in a cause in which a Decree [Dismiss] was pronounced, and

the sum of thereby ordered 10 be recovered, and
in which cause o ‘of was the
plaintiff and of - . was

the defendant, do make oath rand say that bhere is still remaining due and
unpaid of the said sum so érdered t0 be rec¢overed the sum of )
after all just credits and allowances. I refer to the: said Decree [Dismiss]
when produced. ’

- Sworn at ' before me
[description] fOr . . . .o eeveerrino see e [area of
R IR \alzérzsdzctwn] this. »_; day of

I the undersigned solicitor for the plalnmﬁ/defendant certlfy that to
the best of my knowledge: and behef the sum clalmed above is still unpald

- Solicitor

Notes: (a) If the deponent be a party as a personal representative of any

o other person, or 'if he makes this affidavit as personal repre-
sentative of one of the parties in the original cause add after
“allowances ” the words “as I do verily beheve ” .

(b) If the deponent is one of the other pérsons referred to in
Rule 4(2), the above form shall be modified in ‘accordance with
the c1rcumstances and the deponent shall add (i) an explanation
as to why the plaintiff/defendant cannot make the.affidavit,
(i) the deponént’s own qualification ..te make the afﬁdavu:
(iii) (where so required by the Rule) the fact that the matters
deposed to are within his own knowledge, and (iv) his means
of knowledge,




Rules - : 115
ForMm I—ORDER FOR EXTENSION OF DECREE/DISMISS
[Heading and Title as in Decree/Dismiss]

By the County Court Judge

It appearing t6 the Court that notice of an applloatlon to extend the
annexed Decree [Dismiss] at this present sittings was duly served on the
Defendant. [Plaintiff] and that there still remains due on foot of the Decree
[Dismiss] £he SUML 0f....uveereivineiiierinriieerererene It is therefore ordered and
decreed by the Court that the sald Decree [Dismiss] be and the same is
hereby extended for the said sum, together with the sum of....ooii,
costs and expenses of this application, and the Plaintiff [Defendant] shall
have and recover from the Defenrdant [Plaintiff] the same, and the several
Under-Sheriffs in Northern Ireland ware hereby commanded to take in
execution the goods of the Defendant [Plalntlff] to satlsfy and pay the
said Fsum] costs and expenses.

Dated this day of 19
- SEAL Signed, éte.

(Under-Sheriff’s. Warrrant to: be added)

ForRM G—NOTICE .OF PAYMENT INTO COURT
[Heading and Title as in -Civil Bill]

TAKE ‘Notice that the Defendant has paid into court the. sum of

S ;. inh satisfaction of the plalntlff’s claim [for -

and costs. v
‘ [signaturel [datel]

e Defendant/Sohcltor

Form H—NOTICE OF ACGCEPTANGE OF SUM LODGED IN COURT
" [Heading and Title as in Civil Bill]

Taxe Norice that the plaintiff accepts the sum of £ - : paid into
court by-the defendant in satisfaction of his clalm :
[for - 1 and costs. -
: [signature] : [date]
Plaintiff/Solicitor

Form J-—APPLICATION FOR REVIEW OF JUDGMENT OR ORDER OF OFFICER
[Heading and Title as in Civil Bill]

‘ TAKE NOTICE that I hereby apply for & review by the Fudge of the determlna—
tion by the Clerk of the Crown and Peace/Registrar made in the above
action on the day of 19 .

Dated this day- of o 19 i
To the Clerk of the Crown and Peace :
(€313 01-Ts ) T TP SO ROTSU

Plamtlff/Defendant/Sohcltor

- ForMm K—CERTIFICATE TO EXPEDITE HEARING OF APPEAL
[Heading aind Title as in Decree/Dismiss]

To the Registrar 'of the Supreme Court. '

The [plaintiff] [defendant] -desires to appeal agamst a [dismiss]
[decree] given by me in an action brought [nature of claiml...

I am of opinion that it would be just that the hearing of such appeal
should be expedited and that the appeal is it and proper to be heard by
the High ‘Court, and certify accordingly.for the purposes of section 22 of the
Cosunty Courts ‘Act (Northern Iréland), 1955.

EAL
(Date) Signature

County Court Judge



116 COUNTY COURTS

PartT II

Amendment of the Rules made the 12th day of July, 1858,
under Section 64 of the Probates and Letters of
Administration Act (Ireland), 1857.

In RuLE 11, for the words “ twenty running days ” there shall
be substituted the words “ fifteen clear days at least”.

Parr III
Amendments of the County Court (Ireland) Orders, 1890

In OrbEr III, in Rule 7, for the words “two clear days ” there
shall be substituted the words “ five clear days™.

In ORDER VI:—

For Rules 3 and 4 there shall be substztuted respectwely the
following Rules:—
.8, Notwithstanding anything in sectlon 68 of the Civil
© Bill Courts (Ireland) Act, 1851, or section 59 of the County
Officers and Courts (Ireland) Act 18717, all ordinary civil bills,
default civil bills and equity ci‘vil b’il-ls shall be served ﬁfteen
clear days at least before the relevant return day.

“4.-(1) Service of the civil bill in any equity suit shall,
unless the Judge otherwise directs, be effected in thé manner
prescribed for the service of ordinary civil bills.

(2) The Judge may direct service. of any civil bill to be
- substituted, or that service already had be deemed good
service, as the case may be.”

After Rule 4 there shall be inserted the following Rule:‘—

“4A. Where a decree by default is sought against a limited
company, service of the process in acecordance with -section 325
of the Companies Act (Northern Ireland), 1932, shall; not-
withstanding anything in section 59 of the County Ofﬁcers
and Courts (Ireland) Act, 1877, be sufﬁcrent comphance with
the last-mentioned section.”

After Rule 16 there shall be added the following Rules:—

“17. Where a solicitor represents that he is authorlsed to
accept service of any civil bill (other than a civil bill under
gection 59 of the County Officers and Courts (Ireland) Act,
1877, or under section 6A of the Debtors Act (Ireland), 1872)
on behalf of any defendant, the delivery of a ¢opy of the ¢ivil
bill to that seliciter shall be good service if he endorses on the
orlglnal a memorandum stating that he is authorised to aceept
service thereof on behalf of that defendant and that he accepts
service thereof accordingly.

-~ 18. Where a defendant or party to any proceeding is an
infant, a civil bill or other process shall be served on his father
er guardlan or, if he has no father or guardian, on the person
with whom he res1des,




Rules ' 117

Provided that the J udge may ordel that sefvice on the infant
' shall Be good service. -

19. Where a defendant or party to any proceeding is a
person of unsound mind (wheéther or not so found) a civil bill
or other process shall be served on his committee or, if he has
no eommittee, on the person with whom he resides.”

In OrDER VIII:— .
- For Rule 2 there shall be substituted the following Rule:—

“2. The seéveral solicitors shall, at such ftime as the
respective Judges shall appoint for that purpose, deliver to the
Clerk of the Crown and Peace a list arranged in alphabetical

“order of all cases in which they have been employed by
defendants to take defence, or to appear for third parties; and
such solicitors shall be’ deemed to be the solicitors on record
for such parties.”

© In ORDER XV, in Rule 2 the words “in any equity 'suif: ” shall
~ be -omitted.

In ORDER XXII Rules 3, 4 and 5 are revoked.

In ORDER XXXV, at the end of Rule 2 there shall be added the
- following paragraph —

‘“In the apphcatwn of any such scale to actlons for liquidated
sums founded on contract, any such action shall be treated as
undefended if—

(a) no defence is entered and the defendant—
(1) fails to appear at the hearing; or
(ii) appears at the hearing (whether personally or by
_a solicitor) for the purpose only of requesting that
the amount decreed may be made payable by
instalments, or that time be allowed for the
payment of such amount; or

(b) the Judge 1n any special c1rcumstances so directs.”

In ORDER XXXVI:—

For Rule 1 there shall be substituted the followzng Rule!—

“1. Any party in an action, suit or matter who changes his
solicitor shall give to every other party written notice of such
change, stating the name and address of his new solicitor, and
shall lodge a copy of the notice with the Clerk of the CrOWn
ahd Peace, who shall file the same.”

For Rule 14 there shall be substituted the following Rule:—

. “14. Non-compliance with any of these Rules or with any
practice of the court shall not invalidatée any proceedings.
unless the Judge so directs; but any such proceedings may be
set ‘aside wholly or in part as 1rregular or amended, or -
-adjourned or otherwise dealt with in such manner and .upon-
such terms as to costs and. otherwise as the Judge may in his
dlscretmn think fit.”




118 CREAM

In ORrRpER XXXVII:—

Ajter Rule 8 there shall be added the following Rule:—

“9, Where a party is a limited company, any affidavit
required or authorised by any enactment (including these
Orders) to be made by that party may be made by a director,
secretary or other authorised officer.”

In OrbpErR XL fthere shall be added the following Rule:—

“2. No amendment of any of the foregoing Orders nor any
county court rules made under the County Courts Act
(Northern Ireland), 1955, shall, except with the consent of the
parties, apply tc or affect any action, suit, matter or other

- proceeding pending at the date of the coming into operation
of such amendment or rules.”

In the ScHEDULE, in Form 101 (Summons for Witness) for the
amount of ten pounds there shall be substituted the amount of
fifty pounds.

Parr IV

Amendment of the County Court (Proceedings and Actions
before the Registrar for Belfast) Rules, 1948

In Rule 3(1)(b) for the words “ten pounds” there shall be
substituted the words “ twenty pounds ”.

PartT V

Amendment of the Marriages of Minors (Northern Ireland)
County Court Rules, 1954

‘At the end of Rule 5 there shall be added the following words: —

“and for the purpose of any such hearing in chambers the

Judge may sit at any time whether before, at or after the
ordinary sittings of his court.”

CREAM

REGULATIONS DATED 31ST DAY OF JuLy, 1957, MADE BY THE MINISTRY
OF AGRICULTURE FOR NORTHERN IRELAND UNDER SECTION 1 OF THE
SALE oF CREAM ACT (NORTHERN IRELAND) 1957. :

1957. No. 150 A [C]

The Ministry of Agriculture 1n exercise of the powers conferred
on it by Section 1 of the Sale of Cream Act (Northern Ireland)
1957, and of any other power enabling it in that behalf, hereby
rnakes the following Regulations, that is to say:— -



	009884
	009886
	009887
	009888
	009889
	009890
	009891
	009892
	009893
	009894
	009895
	009896
	009897
	009898



