
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made).

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

2019 No. 108

AGRICULTURE

The Agriculture (Student fees)(Amendment)
Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2019

Made       -      -      -      - 16th May 2019

Coming into operation  1st September 2019

THE AGRICULTURE (STUDENT FEES)(AMENDMENT)
REGULATIONS (NORTHERN IRELAND) 2019

1. Citation and commencement  
2. Amendment to the Agriculture (Student fees) Regulations (Northern

Ireland) 2007
 

3. In regulation 4 (1) for “£1,645” substitute “£1,690”:  
4. In regulation 5(2) for “£805” substitute “£825”.  
  Signature  
  Explanatory Note  


