
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

2017 No. 86

The Environmental Impact Assessment (Forestry)
(Amendment) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2017

Regulation 32 (publicity for an environmental statement)

17. In regulation 32—
(a) in paragraph (2)(b), for “28 days” substitute “30 days”;
(b) in paragraph 3(b), for “28 days” substitute “30 days”.


