
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

2017 No. 25

The Motor Vehicles (Compulsory Insurance)
Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2017

Amendment of the Road Traffic (Northern Ireland) Order

2.—(1)  The Road Traffic (Northern Ireland) Order 1981(1) is amended in accordance with
paragraphs (2) and (3).

(2)  In Article 92(2)(b)(2) (requirements in respect of policies) for “£1,000,000” substitute
“£1,200,000”.

(3)  In Article 98(6)(3) (duty of insurers or persons giving security to satisfy judgement against
persons insured or secured against third party risks) for “£1,000,000”, in each place where it occurs,
substitute “£1,200,000”.

(1) S.I. 1981/154 (N.I. 1); relevant amending Regulations are S.R. 1989 No. 84 and S.R. 2007 No. 455
(2) Paragraph (2) was substituted by regulation 3(3) of S.R. 1989 No. 84 and sub-paragraph (b) was amended by regulation 3(2)

of S.R. 2007 No. 455
(3) Article 98 was substituted by regulation 4 of S.R. 1989 No. 84 and paragraph (6) was amended by regulation 3(3) of S.R.

2007 No. 455

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisi/1981/154
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1989/84
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2007/455
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1989/84
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2007/455
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1989/84
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2007/455
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2007/455

