
 

 

S T A T U T O R Y  R U L E S  O F  N O R T H E R N  I R E L A N D  

2015 No. 243 

EDUCATION 

The Student Fees (Amounts) (Amendment) Regulations 

(Northern Ireland) 2015 

Made - - - - 6th May 2015 

Coming into operation - 1st September 2016 

The Department for Employment and Learning makes the following Regulations in exercise of the 

powers conferred by Articles 4(8) and 14(4) of the Higher Education (Northern Ireland) Order 

2005(a). 

In accordance with Article 4(11)(a)(i) and (b)(i) the Department is satisfied that the increases to 

the basic and higher amounts are no greater than are required to maintain the value of those 

amounts in real terms. 

Citation and commencement 

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Student Fees (Amounts) (Amendment) Regulations 

(Northern Ireland) 2015 and shall come into operation on 1st September 2016. 

Increases to the prescribed basic and higher amounts 

2. The Student Fees (Amounts) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2005(b) shall be amended as 

provided by regulations 3 and 4. 

3.—(1) Regulation 3 shall be amended as provided by paragraphs (2) and (3). 

(2) For “£1,510” substitute “£1,555”. 

(3) For “£3,805” substitute “£3,925”. 

4.—(1) Regulation 4 shall be amended as provided by paragraphs (2) and (3). 

(2) For “£740” substitute “£760”. 

(3) For “£1,895” substitute “£1,955”. 

Revocation 

5. The Student Fees (Amounts) (Amendment) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2014(c) are 

revoked. 

                                                                                                                                            

(a) S.I. 2005/1116 (N.I. 5) 
(b) S.R. 2005 No. 290 as amended by S.R. 2006 No. 455, S.R. 2007 No. 442, S.R. 2008 No. 455 and S.R.2009 No. 400, S.R 

2011 No. 1, S.R 2011 No. 369, S.R. 2012 No. 184, S.R. 2013 No. 120 and  S.R. 2014 No. 116 
(c) S.R 2014 No. 116 



 

 

Sealed with the Official Seal of the Department for Employment and Learning on 6th May 2015. 

 

 

 

 

 

 Ms Sian McCleave 

 A senior officer of the Department for Employment and Learning 

 

 

 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 

(This note is not part of the Regulations) 

These Regulations amend the Student Fees (Amounts) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2005 (“the 

2005 Regulations”) by increasing the basic and higher amounts prescribed in the 2005 

Regulations. The amendments come into operation on 1st September 2016. 

The 2005 Regulations prescribe the basic and higher amounts which higher education institutions 

in Northern Ireland may charge by way of tuition fees. Regulation 3 of the 2005 Regulations sets 

out the basic and higher amounts which ordinarily apply. Regulation 4 sets out the lower basic and 

higher amounts which apply in respect of an academic year of specified courses. 

The 2005 Regulations were last amended by the Student Fees (Amounts) (Amendment) 

Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2014, which will come into operation on 1st September 2015 and 

will be revoked by these Regulations. 

____________________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
© Crown copyright 2015 

Printed in the UK by The Stationery Office Limited under the authority and superintendence of Carol Tullo, Controller of Her 
Majesty’s Stationery Office being the Government Printer for Northern Ireland and the Officer appointed to print Acts of the Northern 
Ireland Assembly. 

 

 

£4.25 

 

N6656 05/2015 456656T 19585 9 780337 997945

ISBN 978-0-337-99794-5


