
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

2014 No. 297

The Civil Partnership (Amendment)
Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2014

Amendments to the Civil Partnership Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2005

2.—(1)  The Civil Partnership Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2005(1) shall be amended as
follows.

(2)  In Regulation 3(2) for “14 days” (in each place where it occurs), substitute “28 days”.
(3)  In Regulation 19(b) for “14 days”, substitute “28 days”.
(4)  In Schedule 1 for “14 days”, substitute “28 days”.

(1) S.R. 2005 No. 482

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2005/482

