
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

2013 No. 19

COUNTY COURTS

The County Court (Amendment) Rules (Northern Ireland) 2013

Made       -      -      -      - 31st January 2013

Coming into operation 25th February 2013

THE COUNTY COURT (AMENDMENT)
RULES (NORTHERN IRELAND) 2013

1. Citation, commencement and interpretation  
2. In these Rules, a reference to an Order, rule, Appendix...  
3. Amendments to the County Court Rules (Northern Ireland) 1981  
4. In the following Orders or rules as the case may...  
5. In Order 5, rule 2(6) for “£15,000” substitute “£30,000”.  
6. In Order 5 for rule 3 substitute— Notice for further...  
7. In Order 6A, rule 5(1) for “£5,000” substitute “£10,000”.  
8. In Order 8, rule 3— (a) in paragraph (1A) before...  
9. For Order 14 rule 1 substitute— General procedure (1) Where by

any enactment or by direction of the...
 

10. In Order 14 for rule 6 substitute— Application for interim...  
11. In Order 15— (a) in rule 1—  
12. In Order 19 (Assessors) for rule 5 (Remuneration) substitute—

Remuneration...
 

13. In Order 21, in rule 2(2)(b) for “Rule 36” substitute...  
14. In Order 24— (a) in rule 2B(1) for “any medical...  
15. In Order 33 (Decrees), in rule 10 for paragraph (6)...  
16. In Order 55, rule 11(1)— (a) in sub-paragraph (b) omit...  
17. In Order 55, rule 11 omit paragraphs (4) and (5)....  
18. In Order 55 for rule 17 substitute— Services fee for...  
19. In Order 55, rule 19(1)(a) for “£5,000” substitute “£10,000”.  
20. In Form 2, for “Judge” substitute “judge or district judge”....  
21. In Form 19, for “£15,000” substitute “£30,000”.  
22. In Form 45, after “RECORDER” insert “/DISTRICT JUDGE”.  
23. In Form 47, after “RECORDER” insert “/DISTRICT JUDGE”.  
24. In Form 48, after “RECORDER” insert “/DISTRICT JUDGE”.  
25. In Form 68, in the heading for “ORDER 15, RULE...  
26. Omit Form 68A.  
27. In Form 69A— (a) in the heading for “ORDER 15,...  



Document Generated: 2022-08-26
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

28. For Appendix 2 substitute the new Appendix 2 set out...  
29. Savings  

  Signature  

SCHEDULE
1

SCHEDULE
2
  Explanatory Note  


