
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made).

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

2009 No. 321

Agriculture (Student fees)(Amendment)
Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2009

Citation and commencement

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Agriculture (Student fees)(Amendment) Regulations
(Northern Ireland) 2009 and shall come into operation on the 16th October 2009.

Amendment to the Agriculture (Student fees) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2007

2. The Agriculture (Student fees) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2007(1) shall be amended as
provided by regulations 3 and 4.

3. In Regulation 4(1)(2) for “£1255” substitute “£1285”.

4. In Regulation 5(2)(3) for “£625” substitute “£640”.

Revocations

5. In the Agriculture (Student fees)(Amendment) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2008(4) the
following regulations are revoked—

(1)  Regulation 4(2);
(2)  Regulation 5.

Sealed with the Official Seal of the Department of Agriculture and Rural Development on 16th
September 2009

(L.S.)
Norman Fulton

A senior officer of the Department of Agriculture
and Rural Development

(1) S.R. 2007 No.54
(2) Regulation 4(1) was amended by S.R.2008 No.389
(3) Regulation 5(2) was amended by S.R.2008 No.389
(4) S.R.2008 No.389

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2007/54
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2008/389
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2008/389
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2008/389

