
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

2009 No. 203

The Insolvency (Deposits) (Amendment)
Order (Northern Ireland) 2009

Citation and commencement

1. This Order may be cited as the Insolvency (Deposits) (Amendment) Order (Northern Ireland)
2009 and shall come into operation on 1st October 2009.

Amendments to the Insolvency (Deposits) Order (Northern Ireland) 2006

2.—(1)  Subject to Article 3, the Insolvency (Deposits) Order (Northern Ireland) 2006(1) (the
“principal Order”) shall be amended as provided by paragraphs (2), (3) and (4)—

(2)  In the definition of appropriate deposit in Article 4—
(a) in paragraph (a), for “£620”, there is substituted “£690”;
(b) in paragraph (b), for “£310”, there is substituted “£345”; and
(c) in paragraph (c), for “£370”, there is substituted “£415”.

(3)  In Article 5(1) for “£335”, there is substituted “£315”.
(4)  In Article 5(4) for “deducing” there is substituted “deducting”.

Transitional provisions

3.—(1)  The amendments made by Article 2(2) (a), (b) and (c), increasing the deposits prescribed
by Article 4 of the principal Order, shall apply only to petitions presented on or after 1st October
2009.

(2)  The amendment made by Article 2(3), reducing the fee prescribed by Article 5(1) of the
principal Order, shall apply only to notifications sent to the official receiver on or after 1st October
2009.

Sealed with the Official Seal of the Department of Enterprise, Trade and Investment on 20th May
2009.

Michael J Bohill
A senior officer of the

Department of Enterprise, Trade and Investment

(1) S.R. 2006 No. 55

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2006/55


Document Generated: 2024-04-18
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

The Department of Finance and Personnel concurs with the foregoing Order.
Sealed with the Official Seal of the Department of Finance and Personnel on 20th May 2009.

Jack Layberry
A senior officer of the

Department of Finance and Personnel

2


