Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

2008 No. 292

The Travelling Expenses and Remission of Charges
(Amendment No.2) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2008

Amendment of Schedule 1 to the Principal Regulations

2.—(1) Schedule 1 to the principal Regulations (Modifications of the Income Support (General)
Regulations (Northern Ireland) 1987) is amended as provided by paragraph (2).

(2) In Table A, in the modifications of—
(a) regulation 45 of the Income Support Regulations, for “£21,500” substitute “£22,250”; and
(b) regulation 53 of the Income Support Regulations—
(1) for “£13,000” substitute “£13,500”; and
(ii) for “£21,500” substitute “£22,250”.



