Document Generated: 2023-10-02
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCHEDULE

AMENDMENT OF THE ROYAL ULSTER
CONSTABULARY PENSIONS REGULATIONS 1988

PART 3

11.—(1) In paragraph (c) of the proviso to regulation FI1(1) (reckoning of pensionable service
during maternity leave) for the words “14 weeks” there are substituted the words “18 weeks” in
relation to any period of maternity leave falling on or after 15 December 1999 and ending on 5th
April 2003 (both dates inclusive).

(2) In paragraph (c) of the proviso to regulation F1(1) (reckoning of pensionable service during
maternity leave) for the words “18 weeks” there are substituted the words “26 weeks” in relation to
any period of maternity leave falling on or after 6th April 2003.

(3) Sub-paragraph (1) has effect in relation to any period of maternity leave falling on or after
15th December 1999 and ending on 5th April 2003 (both dates inclusive) and sub-paragraph (2) has
effect in relation to any period of maternity leave falling on or after 6th April 2003.



