Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

2006 No. 207
PHARMACY

The Pharmaceutical Society of Northern Ireland (General)
(Amendment) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2006

Made - - - - 8th May 2006

Coming into operation Ist June 2006

The Council of the Pharmaceutical Society of Northern Ireland, in exercise of the powers conferred
by Article 5 of the Pharmacy (Northern Ireland) Order 1976(1)makes the following Regulations with
the approval of the Department of Health, Social Services and Public Safety(2).

Citation and commencement
1. —

(1) These Regulations may be cited as the Pharmaceutical Society of Northern Ireland (General)
(Amendment) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2006 and shall come into operation on 1st June 2006.

(2) Inthese Regulations “the principal regulations”’means the Pharmaceutical Society of Northern
Ireland (General) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 1994(3).

Amendment of the principal regulations

2. Inregulation 3 of the principal regulations (restoration fees) for “£87there shall be substituted
“£104”.

3. Inregulation 4 of the principal regulations (retention fees)—
(a) in paragraph (1)(a) for “£245there shall be substituted “£295”;
(b) in paragraph (2)(a) for “£113”there shall be substituted “£135”;
(c) in paragraph (2)(b) for “£90”there shall be substituted “£108”;
(d) in paragraph (2)(c) for “£417there shall be substituted “£49”.

(1) S.1.1976/1213 (N.I. 22), the relevant amending regulation is S.R. 2004 No. 78

(2) S.I. 1999/283 (N.I. 1) — Atrticle 3(6)

(3) S.R. 1994 No. 202, as amended by S.R. 1996 No. 187, S.R. 1999 No. 217, S.R. 2002 No. 206, S.R. 2003 No. 356 and S.R.
2005 No. 63


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisi/1976/1213
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2004/78
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisi/1999/283
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1994/202
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1996/187
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1999/217
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2002/206
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2003/356
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2005/63
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2005/63

Document Generated: 2022-08-25
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This

item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

Sealed with the Common Seal of the Pharmaceutical Society of Northern Ireland on 8th May 2006
in the presence of

L.S.

Brendan Kerr
President

Terence T. Hannawin
Secretary & Registrar

The Department of Health, Social Services and Public Safety hereby approves the foregoing
Regulations.

Sealed with the Official Seal of the Department of Health, Social Services and Public Safety on
8th May 2006.

L.S.

Paul Simpson
A Senior Officer of the
Department of Health, Social Services and

Public Safety



Document Generated: 2022-08-25
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

EXPLANATORY NOTE
(This note is not part of the Regulations.)

These Regulations amend the Pharmaceutical Society of Northern Ireland (General) Regulations
(Northern Ireland) 1994 (S.R. 1994 No. 202) by increasing fees payable in respect of—

(a) restoration of a person’s name to the register (regulation 3);

(b) retention fees payable in respect of members of the Society (regulation 4);


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1994/202

