
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

2002 No. 364

ELECTRICITY

Electricity (Applications for Consent) (Fees)
(Amendment) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2002

Made       -      -      -      - 28th November 2002

Coming into operation 1st January 2003

The Department of Enterprise, Trade and Investment(1), in exercise of the powers conferred on it by
Article 39(8) of and paragraph 1(3) of Schedule 8 to the Electricity (Northern Ireland) Order 1992(2)
and of every other power enabling it in that behalf, hereby makes the following Regulations–

Citation and commencement

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Electricity (Applications for Consent) (Fees)
(Amendment) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2002 and shall come into operation on 1st January
2003.

Amendment of the Electricity (Applications for Consent) (Fees) Regulations (Northern
Ireland) 1992

2.—(1)  The Electricity (Applications for Consent) (Fees) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 1992(3)
shall be amended in accordance with paragraphs (2) and (3).

(2)  In Regulation 2(1) (fee for application for consent required for construction etc of generating
stations) for “£100” substitute “£350”.

(3)  In Regulation 2(2) (fee for application for consent required for overhead lines) for “£20”
substitute “£60”.

(1) Formerly the Department of Economic Development; seeS.I.1999/283 (N.I. 1), Article 3(5)
(2) S.I. 1992/231 (N.I. 1)
(3) S.R. 1992 No. 178

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisi/1999/283
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisi/1992/231
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1992/178


Document Generated: 2022-08-25
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

Sealed with the Official Seal of the Department of Enterprise, Trade and Investment on 28th
November 2002.

L.S.
James McKeown

A Senior Officer of the
Department of Enterprise, Trade and Investment

2



Document Generated: 2022-08-25
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

EXPLANATORY NOTE

(This note is not part of the Regulations.)

These Regulations revise upwards the fees which are payable on applications to the Department of
Enterprise, Trade and Investment for its consent under Article 39 of the Electricity (Northern Ireland)
Order 1992 to the construction, extension or operation of a generating station, or under Article 40
of that Order to the installation or keeping installed of an overhead line.

3


