
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

2001 No. 434

The Road Traffic (Health Services Charges)
(Amendment) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2001

Amendment of regulation 4 of the principal Regulations

2. Regulation 4 of the principal Regulations (amount of health services charges — incidents on
or after 2nd July 1997) shall be amended as follows—

(a) in paragraph (2)—
(i) in sub-paragraph (a) for “£354” substitute “£402”;

(ii) in sub-paragraph (b) for “£435” substitute “£494”;
(b) in paragraph (5) for “£10,000” substitute “£30,000”.


