
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

1999 No. 298

The Housing Benefit (General) (Amendment)
Regulations (Northern Ireland) 1999

Amendment of regulation 21 of the principal Regulations

3. In regulation 21(1A) of the principal Regulations(1) (calculation of income on a weekly basis)
—

(a) in sub-paragraph (a) for “£60” there shall be substituted “£70”;
(b) in sub-paragraph (b) for “£100” there shall be substituted “£105”.

(1) Paragraph (1A) was inserted by regulation 2(2)(c) and (3) of S.R. 1997 No. 515

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1997/515

