Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

1997 No. 123

The Housing Benefit (General) (Amendment
No. 2) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 1997

Amendment of regulation 18 of the principal Regulations

2. In regulation 18(1) of the principal Regulations(1) (patients)—
(a) in sub-paragraphs (a), (b) and (d)(ii) for “£15-30” there shall be substituted “£15-60”;
(b) in sub-paragraphs (¢)(i) and (d)(i) for “£12-25” there shall be substituted “£12-50”;
(c) in sub-paragraph (c)(ii) for “£30-60” there shall be substituted “£31-20”.

(1) Regulation 18(1) was amended by regulation 2 of S.R. 1996 No. 84, regulation 7(c) of S.R. 1996 No. 448 and regulation 2
of S.R. 1997 No. 4


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1996/84
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1996/448
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1997/4

