Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

1996 No. 41

Planning (Fees) (Amendment)
Regulations (Northern Ireland) 1996

Amendment of regulations

2.—(1) The Planning (Fees) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 1995(1) are amended in accordance
with paragraphs (2) to (7).

(2) Inregulations 11(1) (reduced fees and refunds), 13(3) (fee for certain deemed applications),
16 (fees for applications for listed building consent) and 19(2) (fee for certain statutory authorities)
for “£30” substitute “£31”.

(3) Inregulation 17(1) (fee for appeals) for “£60” substitute “£65”.
(4) In regulation 18(1) (fee for application for a determination) for “£23” substitute “£27”.

(5) InPartI of Schedule 1 in paragraphs 4(1) (fee for application or deemed application by certain
non-profit making organisations), 5(2) and (3) (fee for certain applications for approval of reserved
matters) for “£175” substitute “£270”.

(6) For Part IT of Schedule 1 substitute Part II set out in the Schedule to these regulations.
(7) In Schedule 2 (fees for applications for consent to display advertisements)—

(a) for “£50” where it twice occurs substitute “£51”;

(b) for “£230” substitute “£236”.

(1) S.R.1995No. 78


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1995/78

