
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

1996 No. 19

County Court (Amendment) Rules (Northern Ireland) 1996

Costs

2.—(1)  Order 19 shall be amended at Rule 5 by deleting the figure “£22·96” and substituting
the figure “£25·54”.

(2)  Order 24 shall be amended, at paragraph 7(a) of Rule 9, by deleting the figure “£9·00”,
and substituting the figure “£10·00” and by deleting the figure “£12·70” and substituting the figure
“£14·12”.

(3)  Order 33 shall be amended, at paragraph (6) of Rule 10, by deleting the figure “£5·22” and
substituting the figure “£5·80”.

(4)  Order 55 shall be amended as follows:—
(a) by deleting, in Rule 13, the figure “80p” and substituting the figure “90p”.
(b) by deleting, in Rule 17, the figure “£1·86” and substituting the figure “£2·06”.

(5)  For Appendix 2 there shall be substituted the new Appendix set out in the Schedule.


