
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

1993 No. 60

The Social Security (Contributions) (Re-
rating) Order (Northern Ireland) 1993

Rate of, and shall earnings exception from, Class 2 contributions

3. In section 11 of the Act (Class 2 contributions)—
(a) in subsection (1) (weekly rate) for “£5 ·35”there shall be substituted “£5·55”;
(b) in subsection (4) (small earnings exception) for “£3,030”there shall be substituted

“£3,140”.


