
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

1991 No. 155

COMPANIES

Companies (Fair Dealing by Directors) (Increase
in Financial Limits) Order (Northern Ireland) 1991

Made       -      -      -      - 15th April 1991

Coming into operation 20th May 1991

The Department of Economic Development, in exercise of the powers conferred on it by Article
353(1) of the Companies (Northern Ireland) Order 1986(1) and of every other power enabling it in
that behalf, hereby makes the following Order:

Citation and commencement

1. This Order may be cited as the Companies (Fair Dealing by Directors) (Increase in Financial
Limits) Order (Northern Ireland) 1991 and shall come into operation on 20th May 1991.

Increase in financial limits

2. Part XI of the Companies (Northern Ireland) Order 1986 (enforcement of fair dealing by
directors) shall be amended as follows:—

(a) in Article 328(2) (substantial property transactions involving directors, etc.) for “£1,000”
substitute “£2,000” and for “£50,000” substitute “£100,000”;

(b) in Article 343(1) (minor and business transactions) for “£5,000” substitute “£10,000”;
(c) in Article 345(3) (funding of director’s expenditure on duty to company) for “£10,000”

substitute “£20,000”;
(d) in Article 348(7) (“value” of transactions and arrangements) for “£50,000” substitute

“£100,000”, and
(e) in Article 352(1) (exceptions from Article 351) for “£1,000” substitute “£2,000”.

(1) S.I. 1986/1032 (N.I. 6)

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisi/1986/1032


Document Generated: 2022-09-01
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

Sealed with the Official Seal of the Department of Economic Development on 15th April 1991.

L.S.
A.H. McAlister

Assistant Secretary

2



Document Generated: 2022-09-01
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

EXPLANATORY NOTE

(This note is not part of the Order.)

This Order increases certain of the financial limits specified in Part XI of the Companies (Northern
Ireland) Order 1986 (enforcement of fair dealing by directors). The limits in question are the sums
specified in Articles 328(2), 343(1), 345(3), 348(7) and 352(1). In each case the sum specified is
doubled. Article 73 of the Companies (No. 2) (Northern Ireland) Order 1990 (S.I. 1990/1504 (N.I.
10)) provides for increases in the other financial limits (relating to loans etc. to directors) specified
in Part XI of the Companies (Northern Ireland) Order 1986.

3

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisi/1990/1504
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisi/1990/1504

