
2240 Nursing Homes 

1990 No. 431 

NURSING HOMES 

No. 431 

Nursing Homes (Registration Fees and Lasers Control) 
(Amendment) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 1990 

Made 

Coming into operation 

11 th December 1990 

14th January 1991 

The Department of Health and Social Services in exercise of the powers 
conferred on it by sections 1(2) and 6(1)(e) of the Nursing Homes and Nursing 
Agencies Act (Northern Ireland) 1971 (a) and of every other power enabling it 

. in that behalf, hereby makes the following regulations: 

Citation and commencement 
1. These regulations may be cited as the Nursing Homes (Registration 

Fees and Lasers Control) (Amendment) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 1990 
and shall come into operation on 14th January 1991. 

Amendment 
2. The Nursing Homes (Registration Fees and Lasers Control) 

Regulations (Northern Ireland) 1986(b) shall be amended as follows-
(a) in regulation 2(1) for "£600." there shall be substituted "£678."; 

and 
(b) in regulation 2(2) for "£380." there shall be substituted "£410.". 

Sealed with the Official Seal of the Department of Health and Social 
Services on 11th December 1990 . 

. (L.s.) J. Scott 
Assistant Secretary 

(a) 1971 c. 32 (N.I.) as amended by S.!. 197211265 (N.!. 14) Art. 109(1) and Sch. 16. S.!. 197811907 
(N.!. 26) Art. 16 and S.1. 1985/1775 (N.I. 19) 

(b) S.R. 1986 No. 166 as amended by S.R. 1988 No. 383 



No. 431 Nursing Homes 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 

(This note is rLOt part of the Regulations.) 

2241 

These regulations amend regulation 20f the Nursing Homes (R'egistration 
Fees and Lasers Control) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 1986 so as to 
increase the fees, assoCiated with the registration of mlrl:\ing. horpes, payable 
to a Health and Social Services Board. . -. . 

The fee to accompany an application for registration is increased from 
£600 to £678. The fee to accompany art application on a proposed change of 
manager is increased from £380 to £410 . 

. 199Q No. 432 

,This Order has been exempted"from :printing by the Statutory Rules 
(Northern Ireland) Orcler 1979. A sumtnary is given in the List of Statutory 
Rules ofa ,Local Character under the headiIlg ROADS. ' 


	0001
	0002



