
No. 350 

Made 

Licences and Licensing 

1985 No . .350 

LICENCES AND LICENSING 

Fees ({ncrease) Order (Northern Ireland) 1985 

9th December 1985 

Coming into operation 3rd February 1986 

To be laid before Parliament under paragraph 3(3) of Schedule 1 
to the Northern Ireland Act 1974 

1393 

The Department of Health and Social Services, in exercise of the powers 
conferred on it by section 1(1) of, and paragraph 5 of Schedule 1 to, the Financial 
Provisions Act (Northern Ireland) 1968(a), and now vested in it(b), and of every 
other power enabling it in that behalf, hereby makes the following Order: 

Citation and commencement 
1. This Order may be cited as the Fees (Increase) Order (Northern Ireland) 1985 

and shall come into operation on 3rd February 1986. 

Increase of fees 
2.-(1) In section 5(3) of the Pedlars Act 1871(c) (pedlar's certificate) for 

"£9·00"(d) there shall be substituted "£12·25". 
(2) In section 3 of the Street Trading (Regulation) Act (Northern Ireland) 1929( e) 

(street trading licence) for "£12·00"(d) there shall be substituted "£15·00". 

Revocation 
3. The Fees (Increase) Order (Northern Ireland) 1982(1) is hereby revoked. 

Sealed with the Official Seal of the Department of Health and Social Services on 
9th December 1985.· 

(L.S.) R. McMurray 
Assistant Secretary 

(a) 1968 c. 25 (N.I.) 
(b) S.R. & O. (N.I.) 1973 No. 504 Article 5; and S.I. 1982/338 (N.I. 6) Article 5 
(c) 1871 c. 96 
(d) Substituted by S.R. 1982 No. 359 
(e) 1929 c. 9 (N.I.) 
(t) S.R. 1982 No. 359 



1394 Licences and Licensing 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 

(This note is not part of the Order.) 

No. 350 

This Order increases the fees (a) for a pedlar's certificate under section 5(3) of the 
Pedlars Act 1871 from £9·00 to £12·25 and (b) for a street trading licence under 
section 3 of the Street Trading (Regulation) Act (Norti,lern Ireland) 1929 from £12 ·00 
to £15·00. 


	00001
	00002



