No. 346 : Police 1263
1978 No. 346
POLICE

Royal Ulster Constabulary Pensions (Amendment No. 3)
Regulations 1978

Made . . . . . . 13th November 1978
Coming into operation . . . Lst December 1978
To be laid before Parliament

The Secretary of State, in pursuance of section 25 of the Police Act
(Northern Ireland) 1970(a) and after consulting, in accordance with section
34(2) of the said Act, the Police Authority for Northern Ireland and the
Police Association for Northern Ireland, and, in accordance with section
4(5) of the Police Act 1969(b), the Police Council for the United Kingdom,
hereby with the concurrence of the Minister for the Civil Service makes the
following regulations:

ParT I

CITATION, COMMENCEMENT AND INTERPRETATION

Citation and commencement

1. These regulations may be cited as the Royal Ulster Constabulary
Pensions (Amendment No. 3) Regulations 1978 and shall come into opera-
tion on 1st December 1978.

Interpretation
2. In these regulations—

“the Order of 1949” means the Royal Ulster Constabulary Pensions
Order 1949(c);

“the principal regulations” means the Royal Ulster Constabulary Pen-
sions Regulations 1973(d).

ParT II
AMENDMENTS TO THE ORDER OF 1949

Widow’s ordinary pension
3. Appendix II to the Schedule to the Order of 1949 shall be amended
as follows:
(@) In both Part I (widow’s flat-rate ordinary pension) and paragraph 3
of Part VIII (widow’s ordinary pension—alternative rate)—
(@) for “£10.60” there shall be substituted “£11.39”;
(ii) for “£9.19” there shall be substituted “£9.87”;
(iii) for “£7.85” there shall be substituted “£8.43”;

%(N .) as modified by S.I 1973/2163 (1973 111, p. 7541)

c.
c.
(c) SR. & O. (N.1.) 1949 No. 211 (p. 379) as amended by S.R. 1977 No. 320 (II . 1758)
R. & 0. (N.L) 1973 No, 317 (II, p. 1722) as amended by S.R. 1977 No. 3 0




1264 " Police ' - No: 346

(b) In paragraph 4 of the said Part: VIHI: (1ncrease in alternative rate) for
“52p” there shall be substltuted “56p”

Child's ordinary allowance

4. Part T of Appendix I to the Schedule to the Order. of 1949 shall be
amended as follows:

(@ In paragraph 1 (chﬂd’s ord1nary allowance—one parent 11v1ng)—
(i) for “£3.24” there shall be substituted “£3.487; ’
(ii) for **£2:81” there shall be substituted: “£3.02”;. = -
(iii) for “£2.58” there shall be substituted “£2.777; - :
() in paragraph 2 (child’s ordinary allowance—both parents dead)——-
(1) for “£5. :33” there shall be substituted “£5.73”;- S
(ii) for “£4. 58” there shall be substituted “£4. 92”
(iii) for “£3.94” there shall be subsututed “£4.24”,

PART III

AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL REGULATIONS

Discretionary pension for widow of Serviceman

5. In regulation 82(5) of sthe principal regulatlons for “£7 85 there shall
be substituted “£8.43”. ;

Widow’s pension
. 6. Schedule 3 to the principal Iegulauons “shall be amemded as follows:
{a) In Part I, paragraph 3 (widow’s alternative . flat rate ordmary
pension)—
(i) for “£10.60” there shall be substituted “£11.39”;
i) for “£9.19” there shall be substituted “£9.87";-
@ii) for “£7.85” there shall be substituted “£8.43”;
(iv) for “52p” there shall be substituted “56p”. A
(b) In Part IV, paragraph 4 (widow’s alternative flat rate accrited
pension)—
(@) for “£10.60” there shall be substituted “£11.39”;
(i) for “£9.19” there shall be substituted “£9.87”;
(iii) for “£7.85" there shall be substituted “£8.43”. .

Child’s ordinary allowance - ‘ s
7. Schedule 4 -to the principal regulations shall be amended as follows
(@) In Part I, paragraph 1(4) (child’s alternatWe flat rate ordinary allow-
" ance—one parent living)— ,

(i) for “£3.24” there shall be substituted “£3. 48”;

(i) for “£2.81” there shall be substitited “£3. 027;

(iii) for “£2.58” there shall be substituted “£2.77”;

(b) In Part I, paragraph 2(4) (child’s alternat.we flat rate ordmary allow-

anoe—both parents dead)—:

(i) for “£4.84” there shall. be substltuted “£5.207;

. (ii) for “£4. 217 there shall be swbstltuted “£4.537

(111) for “£3 86" there shall be substltuted “£4 15” N



No. 346 ~ Police- - 1265

' : . Roy Mason
Northern Ireland Office : ‘ One of Her Majesty’s Principal
13th November 1978 o Secretaries of State

The concurrerice of the Minister for the Civil Service given under his
Oﬁ‘lc1a1 Seal on 13th November 1978

@s) - L T. A. A. Hart
o Authorised by the Minister for
" the Civil Service

EXPLANATORY NOTE

(This note is not part of the regulations but is intended to- indicate
their general purport.) o

These regulations amend the Royal Ulster Constabulary Pensions Order
1949 and the Royal Ulster Constabulary Pensions Regulations 1973.

The amendments 1ncrease certain widows’ pens1ons and children’s allow-
ances payable under those instruments,

The regula’uons ‘take effect as from lst December 1978 (the date from Wthh
increases authorised by the Pensions Increase (Annual Review) Order 1978
are payable) 4



	0001
	0002
	0003



