
Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the Private
Tenancies Act (Northern Ireland) 2022, Section 5. (See end of Document for details)

2022 CHAPTER 20

Increase in time limits for requirements relating to tenancy deposits

5. In Article 5B of the 2006 Order (requirements relating to tenancy deposits)
—

(a) in paragraph (3), for “14 days” substitute “28 days”;
(b) in paragraph (6)(b), for “28 days” substitute “35 days”.

Commencement Information
I1 S. 5 not in operation at Royal Assent, see s. 14(7)
I2 S. 5 in operation at 1.4.2023 by S.R. 2023/20, art. 2, Sch.

1

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nia/2022/20/section/14/7
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nia/2022/20/section/5
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2023/20
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2023/20/article/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2023/20/schedule


Changes to legislation: 
There are currently no known outstanding effects for the Private Tenancies Act
(Northern Ireland) 2022, Section 5.


