
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

WELSH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2010 No. 683

The Accounts and Audit (Wales)
(Amendment) Regulations 2010

Other accounting statements

9.—(1)  Regulation 8 (other accounting statements) is amended as follows.
(2)  In paragraph (2)—

(a) omit sub-paragraph (b);
(b) at the end of sub-paragraph (c) insert—

“; and
(d) a joint committee which is a minor joint committee”.

(3)  In paragraph (3)—
(a) in sub-paragraph (a), for “£100,000” substitute “£200,000”;
(b) in sub-paragraph (a), for “and (2)” substitute “and 7A”;
(c) in sub-paragraph (b), for “£100,000” substitute “£200,000”; and
(d) in sub-paragraph (c), for “£100,000” substitute “£200,000”.

(4)  Omit paragraph (4).


