Document Generated: 2024-04-21
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCHEDULE 6 Article 3

THE TAYSIDE COMBINED POLICE AREA
AMALGAMATION (AMENDMENT) SCHEME 2011

Citation and commencement

1. This scheme may be cited as the Tayside Combined Police Area Amalgamation (Amendment)
Scheme 2011 and comes into force on 22nd March 2011.

Amendment of the Tayside Combined Police Area Amalgamation Scheme 1995

2. Paragraph 12 (financial arrangements) of the Tayside Combined Police Area Amalgamation
Scheme 1995(1) is amended as follows—

(a) in sub-paragraph (1B)(a) for “three per cent.” substitute “four per cent.”; and

(b) in sub-paragraph (1D) for “five per cent.” substitute “eight per cent.”.

(1) S.I. 1995/2643, amended by S.S.1. 2002/140 and 458.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1995/2643
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2002/140
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2002/458

