
Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for
the Budget (Scotland) Act 2003, Section 8. (See end of Document for details)

Budget (Scotland) Act 2003
2003 asp 6

PART 3

MISCELLANEOUS AND SUPPLEMENTARY

Budget revisions

8 Amendment of Budget (Scotland) Act 2001

The Budget (Scotland) Act 2001 (asp 4) is amended as follows—
(a) in section 3(a), for “£17,677,909,000” there is substituted “ £17,705,112,000 ”;
(b) in schedule 1, in the fourth entry—

(i) in column 1, after “Scotland” there is inserted “ for the Student Loans
Scheme and related costs ”;

(ii) in column 2, for “£2,149,014,000” there is substituted “
£2,398,612,000 ”; and

(iii) in column 4, for “£56,340,000” there is substituted “ £76,340,000 ”.



2 Budget (Scotland) Act 2003 asp 6
Document Generated: 2023-05-25

Changes to legislation: 
There are currently no known outstanding effects for the Budget (Scotland) Act 2003, Section 8.


